A BILL

To authorize appropriations for fiscal year 2022 for military activities of the Department of Defense
and for military construction, to prescribe military personnel strengths for such fiscal year, and
for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of America
2 in Congress assembled,

3 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

4 This Act may be cited as the “National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2022”.
5 SEC. 2. TABLE OF CONTENTS.

6 The table of contents for this Act is as follows:

Sec. 1. Short title.
Sec. 2. Table of Contents.

TITLE [—PROCUREMENT
Subtitle A—Authorization of Appropriations
Sec. 101. Army.
Sec. 102. Navy and Marine Corps.
Sec. 103. Air Force and Space Force.
Sec. 104. Defense-wide activities.
Sec. 105. Defense Production Act purchases.
Subtitle B—Other Matters
Sec. 111. Relief from interim cruise missile defense deployment.
Sec. 112. Multiyear procurement authority for UH-60M/HH-60M Black Hawk helicopters.
Sec. 113. Procurement authority for certain parts of the ground-based strategic deterrent cryptographic device.
TITLE II—RESEARCH, DEVELOPMENT, TEST, AND EVALUATION
Sec. 201. Authorization of appropriations.
TITLE III—OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE
Sec. 301. Operation and maintenance funding.
TITLE IV—MILITARY PERSONNEL AUTHORIZATIONS

Subtitle A—Active Forces

Sec. 401. End strengths for active forces.



Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

402. Authority with respect to authorized strengths for general and flag officers within the Armed Forces for
emerging requirements.

Subtitle B—Reserve Forces

411. End strengths for selected reserve.

412. End strengths for reserves on active duty in support of the reserves.

413. End strengths for military technicians (dual status).

414. Maximum number of reserve personnel authorized to be on active duty for operational support.

Subtitle C—Authorization of Appropriations
421. Military personnel.
TITLE V—MILITARY PERSONNEL POLICY

501. Employment authority for civilian faculty at certain military department schools.
502. Amendments to additional Deputy Inspector General of the Department of Defense.

TITLE VI—COMPENSATION AND OTHER PERSONNEL BENEFITS

601. Extension of expiring title 37 authorities.
602. Additional sources of funds available for construction, repair, improvement, and maintenance of
commissary stores.

TITLE VII— HEALTH CARE PROVISIONS
701. Repeal of requirement to transfer research and development functions to Defense Health Agency.
TITLE VIII— ACQUISITION POLICY, ACQUISITION MANAGEMENT, AND RELATED MATTERS

801. Authority to acquire and dispose of materials for the National Defense Stockpile.

802. Removing barriers to, and extension of, the Defense Production Act.

803. Modification and extension of authority for pilot program for development of technology-enhanced
capabilities with partnership intermediaries.

TITLE IX—[RESERVED]
TITLE X—GENERAL PROVISIONS

1001. Information required to comply with policy on response to juvenile-on-juvenile problematic sexual
behavior committed on military installations.
1002. Nondisclosure of certain sensitive military information.

TITLE XI— CIVILIAN PERSONNEL MATTERS

1101. One-year extension of authority to waive annual limitation on premium pay and aggregate limitation on
pay for Federal civilian employees working overseas.

1102. One-year extension of temporary authority to grant allowances, benefits, and gratuities to civilian
personnel on official duty in a combat zone.

TITLE XII— MATTERS RELATING TO FOREIGN NATIONS

1201. Extension and modification of authority for reimbursement of certain coalition nations for support
provided to United States military operations.



Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

1202.
1203.

1204.
1205.
1206.

1401.
1402.
1403.
1404.
1405.

1411.

1412.

1601.
1602.

Afghanistan Security Forces Fund.
Extension of Department of Defense support for reconciliation activities led by the Government of
Afghanistan.
Extension and modification of authority to provide assistance to vetted Syrian groups and individuals.
Extension of authority to provide assistance to counter the Islamic State of Iraq and Syria.
Extension of authority to support operations and activities of the Office of Security Cooperation in Iraq.
TITLE XIII—[RESERVED]
TITLE XIV—OTHER AUTHORIZATIONS
Subtitle A—Military Programs
Working capital funds.
Chemical agents and munitions destruction, defense.
Drug interdiction and counter-drug activities, defense.
Defense Inspector General.
Defense Health Program.
Subtitle B—Other Matters
Authority for transfer of funds to joint Department of Defense-Department of Veterans Affairs medical
facility demonstration fund for Captain James A. Lovell Health Care Center, Illinois.
Authorization of appropriations for Armed Forces Retirement Home.
TITLE XV—[RESERVED]
TITLE XVI— STRATEGIC PROGRAMS, CYBER, AND INTELLIGENCE MATTERS

Authority of Army counterintelligence agents.
Extension of transition of ballistic missile defense programs to the military departments.

DIVISION B— MILITARY CONSTRUCTION AUTHORIZATIONS

TITLE XXI-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXII-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXII-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXIV-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXV-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXVI-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXVII-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXVIII-MILITARY CONSTRUCTION GENERAL PROVISIONS

Sec. 2801. Removal of sunset provision from authority to exempt Department of Defense non-mobile properties

from certain excess property disposal requirements.

Sec. 2802. Modification of statutory cost thresholds for authority to acquire low-cost interests in land.

TITLE I—PROCUREMENT



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

Subtitle A—Authorization of Appropriations

SEC. 101. ARMY.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for procurement for

the Army as follows:

(1) For aircraft, $2,806,452,000.

(2) For missiles, $3,556,251,000.

(3) For ammunition, $2,158,110,000.

(4) For weapons and tracked combat vehicles, $3,875,893,000.

(5) For other procurement, $8,873,558,000.

SEC. 102. NAVY AND MARINE CORPS.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for procurement for

the Navy and Marine Corps as follows:

(1) For aircraft, $16,477,178,000.

(2) For shipbuilding and conversion, $22,571,059,000.

(3) For ammunition procurement, Navy and Marine Corps, $988,018,000.
(4) For weapons, $4,220,705,000.

(5) For other procurement, $10,875,912,000.

(6) For procurement, Marine Corps, $3,043,091,000.

SEC. 103. AIR FORCE AND SPACE FORCE.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for procurement for

the Air Force and Space Force as follows:

(1) For aircraft, $15,727,669,000.

(2) For missiles, $2,669,811,000.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

(3 For procurement, Space Force, $2,766,854,000.
(4) For ammunition, $795,168,000.
(5) For other procurement, $25,251,137,000.
SEC. 104. DEFENSE-WIDE ACTIVITIES.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for Defense-wide
procurement in the amount of $5,548,212,000.
SEC. 105. DEFENSE PRODUCTION ACT PURCHASES.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for purchases under

the Defense Production Act of 1950 (50 U.S.C. 4501 et seq.) in the amount of $340,927,000.
Subtitle B—QOther Matters

SEC. 111. RELIEF FROM INTERIM CRUISE MISSILE DEFENSE DEPLOYMENT.
The following provisions of section 112(b) of the John S. McCain National Defense
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2019 (Public Law 115-232; 132 Stat. 1660) are repealed:
(1) Paragraph (1)(B).
(2) Paragraph (2)(G).
(3) Paragraph (4).
SEC. 112. MULTIYEAR PROCUREMENT AUTHORITY FOR UH-60M/HH-60M
BLACK HAWK HELICOPTERS.
(a) AUTHORITY FOR MULTIYEAR PROCUREMENT.—Subject to section 2306b of title 10,
United States Code, the Secretary of the Army may enter into one or more multiyear contracts
beginning with the fiscal year 2022 program year, for the procurement of UH-60M and HH-60M

Black Hawk helicopters.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(b) CONDITION FOR OUT-YEAR CONTRACT PAYMENTS.—A contract entered into under
subsection (a) shall provide that any obligation of the United States to make a payment under the
contract for a fiscal year after fiscal year 2022 is subject to the availability of appropriations for
that purpose for such later fiscal year.

SEC. 113. PROCUREMENT AUTHORITY FOR CERTAIN PARTS OF THE GROUND-
BASED STRATEGIC DETERRENT CRYPTOGRAPHIC DEVICE.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of the Air Force may enter into contracts for the life-of-
type procurement of covered parts supporting the KS-75 cryptographic device under the Ground
Based Strategic Deterrent program.

(b) AVAILABILITY OF FUNDS.—Notwithstanding section 1502(a) of title 31, United States
Code, of the amount authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 by section 101 and
available for Missile Procurement, Air Force as specified in the funding table in section XXXX,
$10,000,000 shall be available for the procurement of covered parts pursuant to contracts entered
into under subsection (a).

(c) COVERED PARTS DEFINED.—In this section, the term “covered parts” means
commercially available off-the-shelf items as defined in section 104 of title 41, United States

Code.

TITLE II—RESEARCH, DEVELOPMENT, TEST, AND EVALUATION

SEC. 201. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for the use of the
Department of Defense for research, development, test, and evaluation as follows:
(1) For the Army, $12,799,645,000.

(2) For the Navy, $22,639,362,000.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(3) For the Air Force, $39,184,328,000.

(4) For the Space Force, $11,266,387,000.

(5) For Defense-wide activities, $25,857,875,000.

(6) For the Director of Operational Test and Evaluation, $216,591,000.

TITLE II—OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE

SEC. 301. OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE FUNDING.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for the use of the
Armed Forces and other activities and agencies of the Department of Defense for expenses, not
otherwise provided for, for operation and maintenance, in amounts as follows:

(1) For the Army, $54,616,397,000.

(2) For the Navy, $60,441,228,000.

(3) For the Marine Corps, $9,024,791,000.

(4) For the Air Force, $53,876,475,000.

(5) For the Space Force, $3,440,712,000.

(6) For Defense-wide activities, $44,918,366,000.
(7) For the Army Reserve, $3,000,635,000.

(8) For the Navy Reserve, $1,148,698,000.

(9) For the Marine Corps Reserve, $285,050,000.
(10) For the Air Force Reserve, $3,352,106,000.
(11) For the Army National Guard, $7,647,209,000.
(12) For the Air National Guard, $6,574,020,000.
(13) For the United States Court of Appeals for the Armed Forces, $15,589,000.

(14) For Environmental Restoration, Army, $200,806,000.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(15) For Environmental Restoration, Navy, $298,250,000.

(16) For Environmental Restoration, Air Force, $301,768,000.

(17) For Environmental Restoration, Defense-wide, $8,783,000.

(18) For Environmental Restoration, Formerly Used Defense Sites, $218,580,000.

(19) For Overseas Humanitarian, Disaster, and Civic Aid programs,
$110,051,000.

(20) For Cooperative Threat Reduction programs, $239,849,000.

(21) For Department of Defense Acquisition Workforce Development Fund,
$54,679,000.

(22) For Disposal of Department of Defense Real Property, $6,095,000.

(23) For Lease of Department of Defense Real Property, $30,704,000.

(24) For the Afghanistan Security Forces Fund, $3,327,810,000.

(25) Counter-Islamic State of Iraq and Syria Train and Equip Fund, $522,000,000.

TITLE IV—MILITARY PERSONNEL AUTHORIZATIONS

Subtitle A—Active Forces

SEC. 401. END STRENGTHS FOR ACTIVE FORCES.
The Armed Forces are authorized strengths for active duty personnel as of September 30,
2022, as follows:
(1) The Army, 485,000.
(2) The Navy, 346,200.
(3) The Marine Corps, 178,500.
(4) The Air Force, 328,300.

(5) The Space Force, 8,400.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

SEC. 402. AUTHORITY WITH RESPECT TO AUTHORIZED STRENGTHS FOR
GENERAL AND FLAG OFFICERS WITHIN THE ARMED FORCES FOR
EMERGING REQUIREMENTS.

(a) AUTHORITY ON AND BEFORE DECEMBER 31, 2022.—Section 526 of title 10, United

States Code, is amended—
(1) by redesignating subsection (k) as subsection (1); and
(2) by inserting after subsection (j) the following new subsection:

“(k) TRANSFER OF AUTHORIZATIONS AMONG THE MILITARY SERVICES.—(1) The
Secretary of Defense may increase the maximum number of brigadier generals or major generals
in the Army, Air Force, Marine Corps, or Space Force, or rear admirals (lower half) or rear
admirals in the Navy, allowed under subsection (a) and section 525 of this title and the President
may appoint officers in the equivalent grades equal to the number increased by the Secretary of
Defense if each appointment is made in conjunction with an offsetting reduction under paragraph
(2).

“(2) For each increase and appointment made under the authority of paragraph (1) in the
Army, Navy, Air Force, Marine Corps, or Space Force, the number of appointments that may be
made in the equivalent grade in one of the other armed forces (other than the Coast Guard) shall
be reduced by one. When such an increase and appointment is made, the Secretary of Defense
shall specify the armed force in which the reduction required by this paragraph is to be made.

“(3) The total number of general officers and flag officers increased under paragraph (1),
combined with the total number of general officers and flag officers increased under section
526a(i)(1) of this title, may not exceed 15 at any one time.

“(4) The Secretary may not increase the maximum number of general officers or flag

officers under paragraph (1) until the date that is 30 days after the date on which the Secretary



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

provides notice of the increase to the Committees on Armed Services of the House of
Representatives and the Senate.”.

(b) AUTHORITY AFTER DECEMBER 31, 2022.—Section 526a of title 10, United States
Code, is amended by adding at the end the following new subsection:

“(1) TRANSFER OF AUTHORIZATIONS AMONG THE MILITARY SERVICES.—(1) The Secretary
of Defense may increase the maximum number of brigadier generals or major generals in the
Army, Air Force, Marine Corps, or Space Force, or rear admirals (lower half) or rear admirals in
the Navy, allowed under subsection (a) and section 525 of this title and the President may
appoint officers in the equivalent grades equal to the number increased by the Secretary of
Defense if each appointment is made in conjunction with an offsetting reduction under paragraph
(2).

“(2) For each increase and appointment made under the authority of paragraph (1) in the
Army, Navy, Air Force, Marine Corps, or Space Force, the number of appointments that may be
made in the equivalent grade in one of the other armed forces (other than the Coast Guard) shall
be reduced by one. When such an increase and appointment is made, the Secretary of Defense
shall specify the armed force in which the reduction required by this paragraph is to be made.

“(3) The total number of general officers and flag officers increased under paragraph (1),
combined with the total number of general officers and flag officers increased under section
526(k)(1) of this title, may not exceed 15 at any one time.

“(4) The Secretary may not increase the maximum number of general officers or flag
officers under paragraph (1) until the date that is 30 days after the date on which the Secretary
provides notice of the increase to the Committees on Armed Services of the House of

Representatives and the Senate.”.

10



1 Subtitle B—Reserve Forces

2 SEC. 411. END STRENGTHS FOR SELECTED RESERVE.
3 (a) IN GENERAL.—The Armed Forces are authorized strengths for Selected Reserve

4  personnel of the reserve components as of September 30, 2022, as follows:

5 (1) The Army National Guard of the United States, 336,000.
6 (2) The Army Reserve, 189,500.
7 (3) The Navy Reserve, 58,600.
8 (4) The Marine Corps Reserve, 36,800.
9 (5) The Air National Guard of the United States, 108,300.
10 (6) The Air Force Reserve, 70,300.
11 (7) The Coast Guard Reserve, 7,000.
12 (b) END STRENGTH REDUCTIONS.—The end strengths prescribed by subsection (a) for the

13 Selected Reserve of any reserve component shall be proportionately reduced by—

14 (1) the total authorized strength of units organized to serve as units of the Selected
15 Reserve of such component which are on active duty (other than for training) at the end
16 of the fiscal year; and

17 (2) the total number of individual members not in units organized to serve as units
18 of the Selected Reserve of such component who are on active duty (other than for

19 training or for unsatisfactory participation in training) without their consent at the end of
20 the fiscal year.

21 (c) END STRENGTH INCREASES.—Whenever units or individual members of the Selected

22 Reserve for any reserve component are released from active duty during any fiscal year, the end

23 strength prescribed for such fiscal year for the Selected Reserve of such reserve component shall

11



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

be increased proportionately by the total authorized strengths of such units and by the total

number of such individual members.

SEC. 412. END STRENGTHS FOR RESERVES ON ACTIVE DUTY IN SUPPORT OF
THE RESERVES.

Within the end strengths prescribed in section 411(a), the reserve components of the
Armed Forces are authorized, as of September 30, 2022, the following number of Reserves to be
serving on full-time active duty or full-time duty, in the case of members of the National Guard,
for the purpose of organizing, administering, recruiting, instructing, or training the reserve
components:

(1) The Army National Guard of the United States, 30,845.
(2) The Army Reserve, 16,511.
(3) The Navy Reserve, 10,293.
(4) The Marine Corps Reserve, 2,386.
(5) The Air National Guard of the United States, 26,662.
(6) The Air Force Reserve, 6,003.
SEC. 413. END STRENGTHS FOR MILITARY TECHNICIANS (DUAL STATUS).

The minimum number of military technicians (dual status) as of the last day of fiscal year
2022 for the reserve components of the Army and the Air Force (notwithstanding section 129 of
title 10, United States Code) shall be the following:

(1) For the Army National Guard of the United States, 22,294.
(2) For the Army Reserve, 6,492.
(3) For the Air National Guard of the United States, 9,885.

(4) For the Air Force Reserve, 7,111.

12



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

SEC. 414. MAXIMUM NUMBER OF RESERVE PERSONNEL AUTHORIZED TO BE
ON ACTIVE DUTY FOR OPERATIONAL SUPPORT.

During fiscal year 2022, the maximum number of members of the reserve components of
the Armed Forces who may be serving at any time on full-time operational support duty under
section 115(b) of title 10, United States Code, is the following:

(1) The Army National Guard of the United States, 17,000.
(2) The Army Reserve, 13,000.

(3) The Navy Reserve, 6,200.

(4) The Marine Corps Reserve, 3,000.

(5) The Air National Guard of the United States, 16,000.

(6) The Air Force Reserve, 14,000.
Subtitle C—Authorization of Appropriations
SEC. 421. MILITARY PERSONNEL.

There is hereby authorized to be appropriated for military personnel for fiscal year 2022 a
total of $157,947,920,000.
TITLE V—MILITARY PERSONNEL POLICY
SEC. 501. EMPLOYMENT AUTHORITY FOR CIVILIAN FACULTY AT CERTAIN
MILITARY DEPARTMENT SCHOOLS.
(a) ADDITION OF ARMY UNIVERSITY AND ADDITIONAL FACULTY.—
(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 7371 of title 10, United States Code, is amended—
(A) in subsection (a)—

(1) by inserting “academic faculty,” before “and lecturers™; and

13



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

(i1) by striking “the Army War College or the United States Army
Command and General Staff College” and inserting “the Army War
College, the United States Army Command and General Staff College,
and the Army University”’; and
(B) by striking subsection (c).
(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—
(A) SECTION HEADING.—Section 7371 of such title is amended by striking
the section designation and heading and inserting the following:
“§ 7371. Army War College, United States Army Command and General Staff College, and
Army University: civilian faculty members”.
(B) TABLE OF SECTIONS.—The table of sections at the beginning of chapter
747 of such title is amended by striking the item relating to section 7371 and

inserting the following:

“7371. Army War College, United States Army Command and General Staff College, and Army University:
civilian faculty members.”.

(b) ADDITION OF NAVAL UNIVERSITY SYSTEM INSTITUTIONS AND ADDITIONAL
FACULTY.—
(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 8748 of such title is amended—

(A) in subsection (a)—
(1) by inserting “academic faculty,” before “and lecturers”; and
(1) by striking “the Naval War College or of the Marine Corps

University” and inserting “the Naval War College, the Marine Corps

University, or other Naval University System institutions”; and

(B) by striking subsection (c).

14



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—
(A) SECTION HEADING.—Section 8748 of such title is amended by striking
the section designation and heading and inserting the following:
“§ 8748. Naval War College, Marine Corps University, and other Naval University System
institutions: civilian faculty members”.
(B) TABLE OF SECTIONS.—The table of sections at the beginning of chapter
871 of such title is amended by striking the item relating to section 8748 and

inserting the following:

“8748. Naval War College, Marine Corps University, and other Naval University System institutions: civilian
faculty members.”.

(c) AIR UNIVERSITY.—Section 9371 of such title is amended—
(1) in subsection (a), by inserting “academic faculty,” before “and lecturers”; and
(2) by striking subsection (c).
SEC. 502. AMENDMENTS TO ADDITIONAL DEPUTY INSPECTOR GENERAL OF
THE DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE.
Section 554(a) of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry National Defense Authorization Act
for Fiscal Year 2021 (Public Law 116-283) is amended—
(1) in the section heading, by striking “DEPUTY” and inserting “ASSISTANT”;
(2) in paragraph (1)—
(A)in the matter preceding subparagraph (A)—
(1) by striking “Secretary of Defense” and inserting “Inspector
General of the Department of Defense”’; and
(i1) by striking “Deputy” and inserting “Assistant”;

(B) in subparagraph (A), by striking “of the Department”; and

15



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

(C) in subparagraph (B), by striking “report directly to and serve” and
inserting “be”;
(3) in paragraph (2)—
(A) in the matter preceding clause (i) of subparagraph (A)—
(1) by striking “Conducting and supervising” and inserting
“Developing and carrying out a plan for the conduct of comprehensive
oversight, including through the conduct and supervision of”’; and
(i1) by striking “evaluations” and inserting “inspections,”;
(B) in clause (ii) of subparagraph (A), by striking *, including the duties of
the Inspector General under subsection (b)”’; and
(C) in subparagraph (B), by striking “Secretary or”;
(4) in paragraph (3), in the matter preceding subparagraph (A), by striking
“Deputy” and inserting “Assistant”;
(5) in paragraph (4)—
(A) in subparagraph (A), by striking “Deputy” each place it appears and
inserting “Assistant”;
(B) in subparagraph (B)—
(1) by striking “Deputy” the first place it appears;
(i1) by striking “and the Inspector General”;
(ii1) by striking “Deputy” the second place it appears and inserting

“Assistant”; and

16



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(iv) by inserting before the period at the end the following: , for
inclusion in the next semiannual report of the Inspector General under
section 5 of the Inspector General Act of 1978 (5 U.S.C. App.).”;

(C) in subparagraph (C)—

(1) by striking “Deputy”’; and

(i1) by striking “and Inspector General”;
(D) in subparagraph (D)—

(1) by striking “Deputy”’;

(i1) by striking “and the Inspector General”;

(ii1) by striking “Secretary or”’; and

(iv) by striking “direct” and inserting “determine”; and
(E) in subparagraph (E)—

(1) by striking “Deputy” ; and

(i1) by striking “of the Department” and all that follows through
“Representatives” and inserting “consistent with the requirements of the
Inspector General Act of 1978 (5 U.S.C. App.).”.

TITLE VI—COMPENSATION AND OTHER PERSONNEL BENEFITS
SEC. 601. EXTENSION OF EXPIRING TITLE 37 AUTHORITIES.
(a) LODGING IN KIND FOR RESERVE COMPONENT MEMBERS PERFORMING TRAINING.—
(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 12604 of title 10, United States Code, is amended by
adding at the end the following new subsection:
“(c) LODGING IN KIND.—(1) In the case of a member of a reserve component performing

active duty for training or inactive-duty training who is not otherwise entitled to travel and

17



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

transportation allowances in connection with such duty, the Secretary concerned may reimburse
the member for housing service charge expenses incurred by the member in occupying transient
government housing during the performance of such duty. If transient government housing is
unavailable or inadequate, the Secretary concerned may provide the member with lodging in
kind.

“(2) Any payment or other benefit under this subsection shall be provided in accordance
with regulations prescribed by the Secretary concerned.

“(3) The Secretary may pay service charge expenses under paragraph (1) and expenses of
providing lodging in kind under such paragraph out of funds appropriated for operation and
maintenance for the reserve component concerned. Use of a Government charge card is
authorized for payment of these expenses.

“(4) Decisions regarding the availability or adequacy of government housing at a military
installation under paragraph (1) shall be made by the installation commander.”.

(2) REPEAL.—Section 474(1) of title 37, United States Code, is repealed.

(b) MANDATORY PET QUARANTINE FEES FOR HOUSEHOLD PETS.—Section 451(b)(8) of
title 37, United States Code, is amended by adding at the end the following: “Such costs include
pet quarantine expenses.”.

(c) STUDENT DEPENDENT TRANSPORTATION.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 452(b) of title 37, United States Code, is amended by
adding at the end the following new paragraphs:
“(18) Travel by a dependent child to the United States to obtain formal secondary,

undergraduate, graduate, or vocational education, if the permanent duty assignment

18



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

location of the member of the uniformed services is outside the continental United States
(other than in Alaska or Hawaii).

“(19) Travel by a dependent child within the United States to obtain formal
secondary, undergraduate, graduate, or vocational education, if the permanent duty
assignment location of the member of the uniformed services is in Alaska or Hawaii_and
the school is located in a State outside of the permanent duty assignment location.”.

(2) DEFINITIONS.—Section 451 of title 37, United States Code, is amended—

(A) in subsection (a)(2)(H), by adding at the end the following new
clauses:

“(vii) Transportation of a dependent child of a member of the
uniformed services to the United States to obtain formal secondary,
undergraduate, graduate, or vocational education, if the permanent duty
assignment location of the member is outside the continental United States
(other than in Alaska or Hawaii).

“(viil) Transportation of a dependent child of a member of the
uniformed services within the United States to obtain formal secondary,
undergraduate, graduate, or vocational education, if the permanent duty
assignment location of the member is in Alaska or Hawaii and the school
is located in a State outside of the permanent duty assignment location.”;
and
(B) in subsection (b), by adding at the end the following new paragraph:

“(10)(A) The term ‘permanent duty assignment location” means—

“(i) the official station of a member of the uniformed services; or

19



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

“(ii) the residence of a dependent of a member of the uniformed services.

“(B) As used in subparagraph (A)(ii), the residence of a dependent who is a
student not living with the member while at school is the permanent duty assignment
location of the dependent student.”.

(d) DEPENDENT TRANSPORTATION INCIDENT TO SHIP CONSTRUCTION, INACTIVATION, AND
OVERHAULING.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 452 of title 37, United States Code, as amended by
subsection (c) of this section, is further amended—

(A) in subsection (b), by adding at the end the following new paragraph:

“(20) Subject to subsection (i), travel by a dependent to a location where a
member of the uniformed services is on permanent duty aboard a ship that is overhauling,
inactivating, or under construction.”; and

(B) by adding at the end the following new subsection:

“(1) DEPENDENT TRANSPORTATION INCIDENT TO SHIP CONSTRUCTION, INACTIVATION, AND
OVERHAULING.—The authority under subsection (a) for travel in connection with circumstances
described in subsection (b)(19) shall be subject to the following terms and conditions:

“(1) The Service member must be permanently assigned to the ship for 31 or more
consecutive days to be eligible for allowances, and the transportation allowances accrue
on the 31st day and every 60 days thereafter.

“(2) Transportation in kind, reimbursement for personally procured transportation,
or a monetary allowance for mileage in place of the cost of transportation may be

provided, in lieu of the member’s entitlement to transportation, for the member’s

20



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

dependents from the location that was the home port of the ship before commencement of
overhaul or inactivation to the port of overhaul or inactivation.

“(3) The total reimbursement for transportation for the member’s dependents may
not exceed the cost of one Government-procured commercial round-trip travel.”.

(2) DEFINITIONS.—Section 451(a)(2)(H) of title 37, United States Code, as
amended by subsection (c) of this section, is further amended by adding at the end the
following new clause:

“(ix) Transportation of a dependent to a location where a member
of the uniformed services is on permanent duty aboard a ship that is
overhauling, inactivating, or under construction.”.

SEC. 602. ADDITIONAL SOURCES OF FUNDS AVAILABLE FOR CONSTRUCTION,
REPAIR, IMPROVEMENT, AND MAINTENANCE OF COMMISSARY
STORES.

Section 2484(h) of title 10, United States Code, is amended—

(1) in paragraph (5), by adding at the end the following new subparagraphs:

“(F) Contributions for any purpose set forth in paragraph (1) in connection with a
host nation country-to-country agreement.

“(G) Amounts appropriated for repair or reconstruction of a commissary store in
response to a disaster or emergency.”; and

(2) by adding at the end the following new paragraph:

“(6) In addition to the revenues specified in paragraph (5) deposited into the account used
for commissary store surcharge collections, amounts may be transferred to such account from the

following sources and used for the purposes set forth in paragraphs (1), (2), and (3):

21



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

“(A) Balances in nonappropriated and appropriated fund accounts of the
Department of Defense, including Defense Working Capital Fund accounts, derived from
improved management practices implemented pursuant to sections 2481(c)(3), 2485(b),
and 2487(c) of this title.

“(B) Balances in Defense Working Capital Fund commissary operations accounts

derived from the variable pricing program implemented pursuant to subsection (i).”.
TITLE VII— HEALTH CARE PROVISIONS

SEC. 701. REPEAL OF REQUIREMENT TO TRANSFER RESEARCH AND
DEVELOPMENT FUNCTIONS TO DEFENSE HEALTH AGENCY.

Section 1073c¢ of title 10, United States Code, is amended—

(1) by striking subsection (¢) and inserting the following new subsection:

“(e) ADDITIONAL DHA ORGANIZATION.—Not later than September 30, 2022, the
Secretary of Defense, acting through the Director of the Defense Health Agency, shall establish
within the Defense Health Agency a subordinate organization, to be called the Defense Health
Agency Public Health—

“(1) led, at the election of the Director, by a director or commander (to be called
the Director or Commander of Defense Health Agency Public Health); and
“(2) comprised of elements of the Army Public Health Center, the Navy—Marine

Corps Public Health Command, Air Force public health programs, and any other related

defense health activities that the Secretary considers appropriate, including overseas

laboratories focused on preventive medicine, environmental health, and similar matters.”;
(2) by redesignating subsection (g) as subsection (h); and

(3) by inserting after subsection (f) the following new subsection:

22



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

“(g) MEDICAL RESEARCH ORGANIZATIONS AND ACTIVITIES.—The Secretary of Defense,
acting through the Secretaries of the military departments, shall ensure that each military

department maintains department specific medical research organizations and activities.”.

TITLE VIII— ACQUISITION POLICY, ACQUISITION MANAGEMENT,

AND RELATED MATTERS

SEC. 801. AUTHORITY TO ACQUIRE AND DISPOSE OF MATERIALS FOR THE
NATIONAL DEFENSE STOCKPILE.

(a) DISPOSAL AUTHORITY.—Pursuant to section 5(b) of the Strategic and Critical
Materials Stock Piling Act (50 U.S.C. 98d(b)), the National Defense Stockpile Manager may
dispose of 4,031,000 pounds of tungsten ores and concentrates contained in the National Defense
Stockpile (in addition to any amount previously authorized for disposal).

(b) ACQUISITION AUTHORITY.—Using funds available in the National Defense Stockpile
Transaction Fund, the National Defense Stockpile Manager may acquire the following materials
determined to be strategic and critical materials required to meet the defense, industrial, and
essential civilian needs of the United States:

(1) Neodymium oxide, Praseodymium oxide, and Neodymium Iron Boron

(NdFeB) magnet block.

(2) Trinitrotoluene (TNT) or Substitute Materials.
(3) Titanium.

(c) AMOUNT OF AUTHORITY.—The National Defense Stockpile Manager may use up to

$50,000,000 in the National Defense Stockpile Transaction Fund for acquisition of the materials

specified in subsection (b).

23



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

(d) FiscAL YEAR LIMITATION.—The authority under subsection (b) is available for

purchases during fiscal year 2022 through fiscal year 2031.

SEC. 802. REMOVING BARRIERS TO, AND EXTENSION OF, THE DEFENSE
PRODUCTION ACT.

(a) PRESIDENTIAL ACTIONS.—Section 303(a) of the Defense Production Act (50 U.S.C.

4533(a)) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (5), in the matter preceding subparagraph (A), by striking “on a
nondelegable basis” and inserting “or the Secretary of Defense if so delegated”; and

(2) in paragraph (6), by striking subparagraph (C).
(b) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS—Section 711 of the Defense Production Act

(50 U.S.C. 4561) is amended by striking “is authorized to be appropriated $133,000,000 for

fiscal year 2015 and each fiscal year thereafter” and inserting “are hereby authorized to be

appropriated such sums as may be necessary and appropriate”.

SEC. 803. MODIFICATION AND EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY FOR PILOT
PROGRAM FOR DEVELOPMENT OF TECHNOLOGY-ENHANCED
CAPABILITIES WITH PARTNERSHIP INTERMEDIARIES.

(a) MODIFICATION. —Section 851(a) of the National Defense Authorization Act for

Fiscal Year 2020 (Public Law 116-92; 133 Stat. 1510; 10 U.S.C. 2283 note) is amended—

(1) by striking “The Commander” and inserting “The Secretary of Defense may
authorize the Commander”’; and
(2) by striking “the greater of $2,000,000 or 5 percent of the funds required to be

expended by the United States Special Operations Command” and inserting “up to

24



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

$20,000,000 of the funds available to be expended by the United States Special

Operations Command for the purpose of making awards”.

(b) EXTENSION.— Section 851(d) of such Act is amended by striking “2021” and
inserting “2023”.

TITLE IX—[RESERVED]

TITLE X—GENERAL PROVISIONS

SEC. 1001. INFORMATION REQUIRED TO COMPLY WITH POLICY ON RESPONSE
TO JUVENILE-ON-JUVENILE PROBLEMATIC SEXUAL BEHAVIOR
COMMITTED ON MILITARY INSTALLATIONS.

Section 1089 of the John S. McCain National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year
2019 (10 U.S.C. 1781 note; 132 Stat. 1996) is amended by adding at the end the following new
subsection:

“(c) PROVISION OF CERTAIN INFORMATION.—(1) The provision of information from a
juvenile delinquency proceeding, including any associated law enforcement investigation, for
purposes of compliance with the policy required under this section, shall be treated as a release
of records authorized under section 5038 of title 18, United States Code.

“(2) In this subsection, the term ‘juvenile delinquency’ has the meaning given that term
in section 5031 of title 18, United States Code.”.

SEC. 1002. NONDISCLOSURE OF CERTAIN SENSITIVE MILITARY
INFORMATION.

(a) SECTION HEADING.—The heading of section 130e of title 10, United States Code, is
amended to read as follows:

“8§130e. Nondisclosure of certain sensitive military information”.

25



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(b) EXEMPTION.—Section 130e(a) of title 10, Unites States Code, is amended—
(1) in the matter preceding paragraph (1)—
(A) by striking “critical infrastructure security”; and
(B) by striking “pursuant to section 552(b)(3) of title 5,”; and
(2) by amending paragraph (1) to read as follows:
“(1) the information is—
“(A) Department of Defense critical infrastructure security information;
“(B) covered military tactic, technique, or procedure information; or
“(C) covered rule of engagement or rule for the use of force information;
and”.
(c) DESIGNATION OF DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE INFORMATION.—Section 130e(b) of such
title is amended—
(1) in the subsection heading, by striking “CRITICAL INFRASTRUCTURE
SECURITY”’; and
(2) in the first sentence, by striking “may designate information as being
Department of Defense critical infrastructure security information” and inserting “may
designate information as being information identified in subsection (a)(1)”.
(d) INFORMATION PROVIDED TO STATE AND LOCAL GOVERNMENTS.—Section 130e(c) of
such title is amended—
(1) in paragraphs (1) and (2)(A), by striking “critical infrastructure security”; and
(2) in paragraph (2)(B), by striking “Department of Defense critical infrastructure
security information” and inserting “information exempt from disclosure”.

(e) DELEGATION AND TRANSPARENCY.—Section 130e of such title is further amended—

26



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(1) by striking subsection (d);

(2) by redesignating subsection (¢) as subsection (d); and

(3) in subsection (d), as so redesignated—

(A) by striking “, or the Secretary’s designee,”; and
(B) by striking ““, upon request, through the Office of the Director of

Administration and Management” and inserting “in accordance with guidelines

prescribed by the Secretary”.

(f) CITATION FOR PURPOSES OF OPEN FOIA ACT OF 2009.—Section 130e of such title is
further amended by inserting after subsection (d), as redesignated by subsection (e)(2) of this
section, the following new subsection:

“(e) CITATION FOR PURPOSES OF OPEN FOIA AcCT OF 2009.—This section shall be
treated as a statute that specifically exempts certain matters from disclosure under section 552 of
title 5, as described in subsection (b)(3) of that section.”.

(g) DEFINITIONS.—Subsection (f) of such section is amended to read as follows:

“(f) DEFINITIONS.—In this section:

“(1) ADVERSARY.—The term ‘adversary’ means a party acknowledged as
potentially hostile to a friendly party and against which the use of force may be
envisaged.

“(2) COVERED MILITARY TACTIC, TECHNIQUE, OR PROCEDURE INFORMATION.—The
term ‘covered military tactic, technique, or procedure information” means information
that would reveal or consists of a military tactic, technique, or procedure that identifies a
method for using equipment or personnel to accomplish a specific mission under a

particular set of operational or exercise conditions (including offensive, defensive, force

27



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

protection, cyberspace, stability, civil support, freedom of navigation, operations security,
counter intelligence, and intelligence collection operations), the public disclosure of
which could reasonably be expected to provide a military advantage to an adversary.

“(3) COVERED RULE OF ENGAGEMENT OR RULE FOR THE USE OF FORCE
INFORMATION.—The term ‘covered rule of engagement or rule for the use of force
information’ means information that would reveal or consists of a rule of engagement or
rule for the use of force, the public disclosure of which could reasonably be expected to
provide a military advantage to an adversary.

“(4) DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE CRITICAL INFRASTRUCTURE SECURITY
INFORMATION.—The term ‘Department of Defense critical infrastructure security
information’ means sensitive but unclassified information that, if disclosed, would reveal
capabilities or vulnerabilities in Department of Defense critical infrastructure that, if
exploited, would likely result in the significant disruption, destruction, or damage of or to
Department of Defense operations, property, or facilities, including—

“(A) information regarding the securing and safeguarding of explosives,
hazardous chemicals, or pipelines, related to critical infrastructure or protected
equipment and systems owned or operated by or on behalf of the Department of
Defense;

“(B) vulnerability assessments prepared by or on behalf of the Department
of Defense;

“(C) explosives safety information, including storage and handling; and

“(D) other site-specific information on or relating to installation security.

28



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

“(5) MILITARY TACTIC, TECHNIQUE, OR PROCEDURE.—The term ‘military tactic,
technique, or procedure’ means—
“(A) the employment and ordered arrangement of military forces in
relation to each other;
“(B) a non-prescriptive way or method used to perform a mission,
function, or task that is—
“(1) related to or incidental to a combat mission or contingency
operation; or
“(i1) directly related to preparing for, going to, or returning from a
combat mission or contingency operation; or
“(C) detailed steps that prescribe how to perform a specific task that is—
“(1) related to, or incidental to, a combat mission, force protection
operation, or contingency operation; or
“(i1) directly related to preparing for, going to, or returning from a
combat mission, force protection operation, or contingency operation.
“(6) RULE FOR THE USE OF FORCE.—The term ‘rule for the use of force’ means a
directive issued to guide armed forces on the use of force during various operations.
“(7) RULE OF ENGAGEMENT.—The term ‘rule of engagement’ means a directive
issued by a competent military authority that delineates the circumstances and limitations
under which the armed forces will initiate or continue combat engagement with other
forces encountered.”.
(1) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The item relating to section 130e in the table of sections at

the beginning of chapter 3 of such title is amended to read as follows:

“130e. Nondisclosure of certain sensitive military information.”.

29



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

TITLE XI— CIVILIAN PERSONNEL MATTERS

SEC. 1101. ONE-YEAR EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY TO WAIVE ANNUAL
LIMITATION ON PREMIUM PAY AND AGGREGATE LIMITATION
ON PAY FOR FEDERAL CIVILIAN EMPLOYEES WORKING
OVERSEAS.

Subsection (a) of section 1101 of the Duncan Hunter National Defense Authorization Act
for Fiscal Year 2009 (Public Law 110-417; 122 Stat. 4615), as most recently amended by section
1105 of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year
2021 (Public Law 116-283), is further amended by striking “through 2021 and inserting
“through 2022”.

SEC. 1102. ONE-YEAR EXTENSION OF TEMPORARY AUTHORITY TO GRANT
ALLOWANCES, BENEFITS, AND GRATUITIES TO CIVILIAN
PERSONNEL ON OFFICIAL DUTY IN A COMBAT ZONE.

Paragraph (2) of section 1603(a) of the Emergency Supplemental Appropriations Act for
Defense, the Global War on Terror, and Hurricane Recovery, 2006 (Public Law 109-234; 120
Stat. 443), as added by section 1102 of the Duncan Hunter National Defense Authorization Act
for Fiscal Year 2009 (Public Law 110-417; 122 Stat. 4616) and as most recently amended by
section 1106 of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal

Year 2021 (Public Law 116-283), is further amended by striking “2022” and inserting “2023.
TITLE XII— MATTERS RELATING TO FOREIGN NATIONS

SEC. 1201. EXTENSION AND MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITY FOR
REIMBURSEMENT OF CERTAIN COALITION NATIONS FOR

SUPPORT PROVIDED TO UNITED STATES MILITARY OPERATIONS.

30



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(a) EXTENSION.—Subsection (a) of section 1233 of the National Defense Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2008 (Public Law 110-181; 122 Stat. 393), as most recently amended by
section 1211 of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal
Year 2021 (Public Law 116-283), is further amended in the matter preceding paragraph (1) by
striking “beginning on October 1, 2020, and ending on December 31, 2021” and inserting
“beginning on October 1, 2021, and ending on December 31, 2022,

(b) MODIFICATION TO LIMITATIONS.—Subsection (d)(1) of such section is amended—

(1) by striking “beginning on October 1, 2020, and ending on December 31,
20217 and inserting “beginning on October 1, 2021, and ending on December 31, 2022”;
and
(2) by striking “$180,000,000” and inserting “$160,000,000”.
SEC. 1202. AFGHANISTAN SECURITY FORCES FUND.

(a) CONTINUATION OF PRIOR AUTHORITIES AND NOTICE AND REPORTING
REQUIREMENTS.—Funds available to the Department of Defense for the Afghanistan Security
Forces Fund for fiscal year 2022 shall be subject to the conditions contained in—

(1) subsections (b) through (f) of section 1513 of the National Defense

Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2008 (Public Law 110-181; 122 Stat. 428); and

(2) section 1521(d)(1) of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year

2017 (Public Law 114-328; 130 Stat. 2577).

(b) USE OF FUNDS.—

(1) MINISTRY OF DEFENSE ADVISORS.—Subsection (b)(1) of such section 1513 is
amended by inserting before the period the following: *, including costs of Department of

Defense personnel who advise those Ministries”.

31



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(2) TYPE OF ASSISTANCE.—Subsection (b)(2) of such section 1513 is amended by
inserting “(including program and security assistance management support)” after
“services”.

(c) EQUIPMENT DISPOSITION.—

(1) ACCEPTANCE OF CERTAIN EQUIPMENT.—Subject to paragraph (2), the
Secretary of Defense may accept equipment that is procured using amounts authorized to
be appropriated for the Afghanistan Security Forces Fund by this Act and is intended for
transfer to the security forces of the Ministry of Defense and the Ministry of the Interior
of the Government of Afghanistan, but is not accepted by such security forces.

(2) CONDITIONS ON ACCEPTANCE OF EQUIPMENT.—Before accepting any
equipment under the authority provided by paragraph (1), the Commander of United
States forces in Afghanistan shall make a determination that such equipment was
procured for the purpose of meeting requirements of the security forces of the Ministry of
Defense and the Ministry of the Interior of the Government of Afghanistan, as agreed to
by both the Government of Afghanistan and the Government of the United States, but is
no longer required by such security forces or was damaged before transfer to such
security forces.

(3) ELEMENTS OF DETERMINATION.—In making a determination under paragraph
(2) regarding equipment, the Commander of United States forces in Afghanistan shall
consider alternatives to acceptance of such equipment by the Secretary of Defense.

(4) TREATMENT AS DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE STOCKS.—Equipment accepted
under the authority provided by paragraph (1) may be treated as stocks of the Department

of Defense upon notification to the congressional defense committees of such treatment.

32



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(d) REIMBURSABLE TRANSACTION AUTHORITY FOR CH-47 HELICOPTERS.—

(1) AUTHORITY.—The Secretary of Defense may use amounts authorized for the

Afghanistan Security Forces Fund in this Act or the National Defense Authorization Act

for Fiscal Year 2021 to purchase CH-47 Chinook helicopters from the Secretary of the

Army.

(2) REIMBURSEMENT AMOUNT.—The Secretary of Defense shall reimburse the

Secretary of the Army for the full replacement value of the helicopters purchased in each

transaction made under the authority of paragraph (1).

SEC. 1203. EXTENSION OF DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE SUPPORT FOR
RECONCILIATION ACTIVITIES LED BY THE GOVERNMENT OF
AFGHANISTAN.

Section 1218(k) of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2020
(Public Law 116-92), as most recently amended by section 1213 of the William M. (Mac)
Thornberry National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2021 (Public Law 116-283),
is amended by striking “December 31, 2021 and inserting “December 31, 2022”.

SEC. 1204. EXTENSION AND MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITY TO PROVIDE
ASSISTANCE TO VETTED SYRIAN GROUPS AND INDIVIDUALS.

(a) EXTENSION.—Subsection (a) of section 1209 of the Carl Levin and Howard P. “Buck”
McKeon National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2015 (Public Law 113-291; 128
Stat. 3559), as most recently amended by section 1222 of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry
National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2021 (Public Law 116-283), is further
amended by striking “December 31, 2021” and inserting “December 31, 2023”.

(b) ACCOUNTING OF EXPENDITURES.—Such section 1209 is further amended—

33



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

(1) by striking subsections (b) and (c);
(2) by redesignating subsections (d) through (m) as subsections (b) through (k),
respectively; and
(3) in paragraph (2) of subsection (b) (as redesignated by paragraph (2) of this
subsection)—
(A) by redesignating subclause (I) of subparagraph (J)(iii) as subparagraph
(K) and conforming the margins accordingly; and
(B) by adding at the end the following new subparagraph:
“(L) An accounting of the funds expended to provide assistance under
subsection (a).”.

(c) LIMITATION ON COST OF CONSTRUCTION AND REPAIR PROJECTS.—Subsection (j) of

such section 1209, as redesignated by subsection (b)(2) of this section, is further amended—
(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “may not exceed” and all that follows and
inserting “in any fiscal year may not exceed $20,000,000 in the aggregate.”; and
(2) in paragraph (2), by striking “per-project or aggregate”.
SEC. 1205. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY TO PROVIDE ASSISTANCE TO COUNTER
THE ISLAMIC STATE OF IRAQ AND SYRIA.

(a) EXTENSION.—Subsection (a) of section 1236 of the Carl Levin and Howard P. “Buck”
McKeon National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2015 (Public Law 113-291; 128
Stat. 3559), as most recently amended by section 1221 of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry
National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2021 (Public Law 116-283), is further
amended by striking “December 31, 2021” and inserting “December 31, 2023”.

(b) FUNDING.—Subsection (g) of such section 1236 is amended—

34



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

(1) by striking “Overseas Contingency Operations for fiscal year 2021” and
inserting “fiscal year 2022”; and

(2) by striking “$322,500,000” and inserting “$345,000,000”.
(c) COST-SHARING REQUIREMENT.—Subsection (k)(1) of such section 1236 is amended—

(1) by striking “60 percent” and inserting “75 percent”;

(2) by striking “40 percent” and inserting “30 percent”; and

(3) by striking “50 percent” and inserting “25 percent”.
(d) ASSESSMENT.—Subsection (1)(1)(B) of such section 1236 is amended—

(1) by striking clause (ii);

(2) by redesignating clauses (iii) through (vii) as clauses (ii) through (vi),
respectively; and

(3) in clause (iv), as redesignated by paragraph (2) of this subsection, by striking
“, and, once established, the Iraqi Sunni National Guard”.
(e) LIMITATION ON AGGREGATE COST OF CONSTRUCTION, REPAIR, AND RENOVATION

PROJECTS.—Subsection (m) of such section 1236 is amended—

(1) by striking “RENOVATION PROJECTS.—The aggregate” and inserting the
following: “RENOVATION PROJECTS.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The aggregate”; and

(2) by adding at the end the following new paragraph:

“(2) FOREIGN CONTRIBUTIONS.—The limitation under paragraph (1) shall not
apply to the expenditure of foreign contributions in excess of the limitation set forth in

that paragraph.”.

35



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

SEC. 1206. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY TO SUPPORT OPERATIONS AND
ACTIVITIES OF THE OFFICE OF SECURITY COOPERATION IN
IRAQ.

(a) EXTENSION.—Subsections (c¢) and (d) of section 1215 of the National Defense
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2012 (10 U.S.C. 113 note), as most recently amended by
section 1223 of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry National Defense Authorization Act for
Fiscal Year 2021 (Public Law 116-283), are each amended by striking “fiscal year 2021” and
inserting “fiscal year 2022”.

(b) FUNDING LIMITATION.—Subsection (¢) of such section 1215, as amended by
subsection (a) of this section, is further amended by striking “$25,000,000” and inserting
“$30,000,000”.

TITLE XIII—[RESERVED]
TITLE XIV—OTHER AUTHORIZATIONS

Subtitle A—Military Programs

SEC. 1401. WORKING CAPITAL FUNDS.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for the use of the
Armed Forces and other activities and agencies of the Department of Defense for providing
capital for working capital and revolving funds in the amount of $1,902,000,000.

SEC. 1402. CHEMICAL AGENTS AND MUNITIONS DESTRUCTION, DEFENSE.
(a) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Funds are hereby authorized to be
appropriated for the Department of Defense for fiscal year 2022 for expenses, not otherwise

provided for, for Chemical Agents and Munitions Destruction, Defense, in the amount of

$1,094,352,000 of which—

36



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

(1) $93,121,000 is for Operation and Maintenance; and
(2) $1,001,231,000 is for Research, Development, Test, and Evaluation.
(b) USE.—Amounts authorized to be appropriated under subsection (a) are authorized
for—
(1) the destruction of lethal chemical agents and munitions in accordance with
section 1412 of the Department of Defense Authorization Act, 1986 (50 U.S.C. 1521);
and
(2) the destruction of chemical warfare materiel of the United States that is not
covered by section 1412 of such Act.
SEC. 1403. DRUG INTERDICTION AND COUNTER-DRUG ACTIVITIES, DEFENSE.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for the Department of Defense for fiscal
year 2022 for expenses, not otherwise provided for, for Drug Interdiction and Counter-Drug
Activities, Defense, in the amount of $821,908,000.

SEC. 1404. DEFENSE INSPECTOR GENERAL.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for the Department of Defense for fiscal
year 2022 for expenses, not otherwise provided for, for the Office of the Inspector General of the
Department of Defense, in the amount of $438,363,000 of which—

(1) $435,918,000 is for Operation and Maintenance;
(2) $2,365,000 is for Research, Development, Test and Evaluation; and
(3) $80,000 is for Procurement.

SEC. 1405. DEFENSE HEALTH PROGRAM.

37



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for the Department of Defense for fiscal
year 2022 for expenses, not otherwise provided for, for the Defense Health Program, in the
amount of $35,592.408,000 of which—

(1) $34,182,719,000 is for Operation and Maintenance;
(2) $630,681,000 is for Research, Development, Test, and Evaluation; and

(3) $779,008,000 is for Procurement.
Subtitle B—Other Matters

SEC. 1411. AUTHORITY FOR TRANSFER OF FUNDS TO JOINT DEPARTMENT OF
DEFENSE-DEPARTMENT OF VETERANS AFFAIRS MEDICAL
FACILITY DEMONSTRATION FUND FOR CAPTAIN JAMES A.
LOVELL HEALTH CARE CENTER, ILLINOIS.

(a) AUTHORITY FOR TRANSFER OF FUNDS.—Of the funds authorized to be appropriated
for section 1405 and available for the Defense Health Program for operation and maintenance,
$137,000,000 may be transferred by the Secretary of Defense to the Joint Department of
Defense—Department of Veterans Affairs Medical Facility Demonstration Fund established by
subsection (a)(1) of section 1704 of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2010
(Public Law 111-84; 123 Stat. 2571). For purposes of subsection (a)(2) of such section 1704, any
funds so transferred shall be treated as amounts authorized and appropriated specifically for the
purpose of such a transfer.

(b) USE OF TRANSFERRED FUNDS.—For the purposes of subsection (b) of such section
1704, facility operations for which funds transferred under subsection (a) may be used are
operations of the Captain James A. Lovell Federal Health Care Center, consisting of the North

Chicago Veterans Affairs Medical Center, the Navy Ambulatory Care Center, and supporting

38



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

facilities designated as a combined Federal medical facility under an operational agreement
covered by section 706 of the Duncan Hunter National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal
Year 2009 (Public Law 110-417; 122 Stat. 4500).
SEC. 1412. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS FOR ARMED FORCES
RETIREMENT HOME.
There is hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 from the Armed Forces
Retirement Home Trust Fund the sum of $75,300,000 for the operation of the Armed Forces

Retirement Home.

TITLE XV—[RESERVED]
TITLE XVI— STRATEGIC PROGRAMS, CYBER, AND INTELLIGENCE

MATTERS

SEC. 1601. AUTHORITY OF ARMY COUNTERINTELLIGENCE AGENTS.
(a) AUTHORITY TO EXECUTE WARRANTS AND MAKE ARRESTS.—Section 7377 of title 10,
United States Code, is amended—
(1) in the section heading, by inserting “and Army Counterintelligence
Command” before the colon”; and
(2) in subsection (b)—
(A) by striking “any employee of the Department of the Army who is” and
inserting the following: “any employee of the Department of the Army—
“(1) who is”;
(B) in paragraph (1) (as so designated) by striking the period at the end
and inserting “‘; or”’; and

(C) by adding at the end the following new paragraph:

39



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

“(2) who is a special agent of the Army Counterintelligence Command (or a
successor to that command) whose duties include conducting, supervising, or
coordinating counterintelligence investigations involving potential or alleged violations
punishable under chapter 37, 113B, or 115 of title 18 and similar offenses punishable
under this title.”.

(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of sections at the beginning of chapter 747 of
such title is amended by striking the item relating to section 7377 and inserting the following

new item:

“7377. Civilian special agents of the Criminal Investigation Command and Army Counterintelligence Command:
authority to execute warrants and make arrests.”.

SEC. 1602. EXTENSION OF TRANSITION OF BALLISTIC MISSILE DEFENSE
PROGRAMS TO THE MILITARY DEPARTMENTS.
Section 1676(b)(1) of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2018 (P.L.

115-91; 10 U.S.C. 2431 note) is amended by striking “2023” and inserting “2024”.

DIVISION B— MILITARY CONSTRUCTION AUTHORIZATIONS

TITLE XXI-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXII-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXIII-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXIV-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXV-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXVI-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXVII-[RESERVED]

TITLE XXVIII-MILITARY CONSTRUCTION GENERAL PROVISIONS

40



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

SEC. 2801. REMOVAL OF SUNSET PROVISION FROM AUTHORITY TO EXEMPT
DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE NON-MOBILE PROPERTIES FROM
CERTAIN EXCESS PROPERTY DISPOSAL REQUIREMENTS.
Section 2822 of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2019 (42 U.S.C.
11411 note; Public Law 115-232) is amended by striking subsection (d).
SEC. 2802. MODIFICATION OF STATUTORY COST THRESHOLDS FOR
AUTHORITY TO ACQUIRE LOW-COST INTERESTS IN LAND.
Section 2663(c) of title 10, United States Code, is amended—
(1) in paragraph (1)(B), by striking “$750,000” and inserting “$6,000,000”;
(2) by striking paragraph (2);
(3) by redesignating paragraphs (3) and (4) as paragraphs (2) and (3),
respectively; and
(4) in paragraph (2), as redesignated by paragraph (3) of this section, by striking
“unless the total cost is not more than $750,000, in the case of an acquisition under
paragraph (1), or $1,500,000, in the case of an acquisition under paragraph (2)” and

inserting “unless the total cost is not more than $6,000,000”.

41



	Section 1. Short title.
	This Act may be cited as the “National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2022”.

	Sec. 2. Table of Contents.
	The table of contents for this Act is as follows:

	TITLE I—PROCUREMENT
	Subtitle A—Authorization of Appropriations
	Sec. 101. Army.
	Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for procurement for the Army as follows:
	(1) For aircraft, $2,806,452,000.
	(2) For missiles, $3,556,251,000.
	(3) For ammunition, $2,158,110,000.
	(4) For weapons and tracked combat vehicles, $3,875,893,000.
	(5) For other procurement, $8,873,558,000.


	Sec. 102. Navy and Marine Corps.
	Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for procurement for the Navy and Marine Corps as follows:
	(1) For aircraft, $16,477,178,000.
	(2) For shipbuilding and conversion, $22,571,059,000.
	(3) For ammunition procurement, Navy and Marine Corps, $988,018,000.
	(4) For weapons, $4,220,705,000.
	(5) For other procurement, $10,875,912,000.
	(6) For procurement, Marine Corps, $3,043,091,000.


	Sec. 103. Air Force and Space Force.
	Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for procurement for the Air Force and Space Force as follows:
	(1) For aircraft, $15,727,669,000.
	(2) For missiles, $2,669,811,000.
	(3 For procurement, Space Force, $2,766,854,000.
	(4) For ammunition, $795,168,000.
	(5) For other procurement, $25,251,137,000.


	Sec. 104. Defense-wide activities.
	Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for Defense-wide procurement in the amount of $5,548,212,000.

	Sec. 105. Defense Production Act purchases.
	Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for purchases under the Defense Production Act of 1950 (50 U.S.C. 4501 et seq.) in the amount of $340,927,000.


	Subtitle B—Other Matters
	Sec. 111. Relief from interim cruise missile defense deployment.
	The following provisions of section 112(b) of the John S. McCain National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2019 (Public Law 115-232; 132 Stat. 1660) are repealed:
	(1) Paragraph (1)(B).
	(2) Paragraph (2)(G).
	(3) Paragraph (4).


	Sec. 112. Multiyear procurement authority for UH-60M/HH-60M Black Hawk helicopters.
	Sec. 113. Procurement authority for certain parts of the ground-based strategic deterrent cryptographic device.
	(a) In General.—The Secretary of the Air Force may enter into contracts for the life-of-type procurement of covered parts supporting the KS-75 cryptographic device under the Ground Based Strategic Deterrent program.
	(b) Availability of Funds.—Notwithstanding section 1502(a) of title 31, United States Code, of the amount authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 by section 101 and available for Missile Procurement, Air Force as specified in the funding ta...
	(c) Covered Parts Defined.—In this section, the term “covered parts” means commercially available off-the-shelf items as defined in section 104 of title 41, United States Code.


	TITLE II—RESEARCH, DEVELOPMENT, TEST, AND EVALUATION
	Sec. 201. Authorization of appropriations.
	Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for the use of the Department of Defense for research, development, test, and evaluation as follows:
	(1) For the Army, $12,799,645,000.
	(2) For the Navy, $22,639,362,000.
	(3) For the Air Force, $39,184,328,000.
	(4) For the Space Force, $11,266,387,000.
	(5) For Defense-wide activities, $25,857,875,000.
	(6) For the Director of Operational Test and Evaluation, $216,591,000.



	TITLE III—OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE
	Sec. 301. Operation and maintenance funding.
	Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for the use of the Armed Forces and other activities and agencies of the Department of Defense for expenses, not otherwise provided for, for operation and maintenance, in amounts as f...
	(1) For the Army, $54,616,397,000.
	(2) For the Navy, $60,441,228,000.
	(3) For the Marine Corps, $9,024,791,000.
	(4) For the Air Force, $53,876,475,000.
	(5) For the Space Force, $3,440,712,000.
	(6) For Defense-wide activities, $44,918,366,000.
	(7) For the Army Reserve, $3,000,635,000.
	(8) For the Navy Reserve, $1,148,698,000.
	(9) For the Marine Corps Reserve, $285,050,000.
	(10) For the Air Force Reserve, $3,352,106,000.
	(11) For the Army National Guard, $7,647,209,000.
	(12) For the Air National Guard, $6,574,020,000.
	(13) For the United States Court of Appeals for the Armed Forces, $15,589,000.
	(14) For Environmental Restoration, Army, $200,806,000.
	(15) For Environmental Restoration, Navy, $298,250,000.
	(16) For Environmental Restoration, Air Force, $301,768,000.
	(17) For Environmental Restoration, Defense-wide, $8,783,000.
	(18) For Environmental Restoration, Formerly Used Defense Sites, $218,580,000.
	(19) For Overseas Humanitarian, Disaster, and Civic Aid programs, $110,051,000.
	(20) For Cooperative Threat Reduction programs, $239,849,000.
	(21) For Department of Defense Acquisition Workforce Development Fund, $54,679,000.
	(22) For Disposal of Department of Defense Real Property, $6,095,000.
	(23) For Lease of Department of Defense Real Property, $30,704,000.
	(24) For the Afghanistan Security Forces Fund, $3,327,810,000.
	(25) Counter-Islamic State of Iraq and Syria Train and Equip Fund, $522,000,000.



	TITLE IV—MILITARY PERSONNEL AUTHORIZATIONS
	Subtitle A—Active Forces
	Sec. 401. End strengths for active forces.
	The Armed Forces are authorized strengths for active duty personnel as of September 30, 2022, as follows:
	(1) The Army, 485,000.
	(2) The Navy, 346,200.
	(3) The Marine Corps, 178,500.
	(4) The Air Force, 328,300.
	(5) The Space Force, 8,400.


	Sec. 402. Authority with respect to authorized strengths for general and flag officers within the Armed Forces for emerging requirements.
	(a) Authority on and Before December 31, 2022.—Section 526 of title 10, United States Code, is amended—
	(1) by redesignating subsection (k) as subsection (l); and
	(2) by inserting after subsection (j) the following new subsection:

	“(k) Transfer of Authorizations Among the Military Services.—(1) The Secretary of Defense may increase the maximum number of brigadier generals or major generals in the Army, Air Force, Marine Corps, or Space Force, or rear admirals (lower half) or re...
	“(2) For each increase and appointment made under the authority of paragraph (1) in the Army, Navy, Air Force, Marine Corps, or Space Force, the number of appointments that may be made in the equivalent grade in one of the other armed forces (other th...
	“(3) The total number of general officers and flag officers increased under paragraph (1), combined with the total number of general officers and flag officers increased under section 526a(i)(1) of this title, may not exceed 15 at any one time.
	“(4) The Secretary may not increase the maximum number of general officers or flag officers under paragraph (1) until the date that is 30 days after the date on which the Secretary provides notice of the increase to the Committees on Armed Services of...
	(b) Authority After December 31, 2022.—Section 526a of title 10, United States Code, is amended by adding at the end the following new subsection:
	“(i) Transfer of Authorizations Among the Military Services.—(1) The Secretary of Defense may increase the maximum number of brigadier generals or major generals in the Army, Air Force, Marine Corps, or Space Force, or rear admirals (lower half) or re...
	“(2) For each increase and appointment made under the authority of paragraph (1) in the Army, Navy, Air Force, Marine Corps, or Space Force, the number of appointments that may be made in the equivalent grade in one of the other armed forces (other th...
	“(3) The total number of general officers and flag officers increased under paragraph (1), combined with the total number of general officers and flag officers increased under section 526(k)(1) of this title, may not exceed 15 at any one time.
	“(4) The Secretary may not increase the maximum number of general officers or flag officers under paragraph (1) until the date that is 30 days after the date on which the Secretary provides notice of the increase to the Committees on Armed Services of...


	Subtitle B—Reserve Forces
	Sec. 411. End strengths for selected reserve.
	(a) In General.—The Armed Forces are authorized strengths for Selected Reserve personnel of the reserve components as of September 30, 2022, as follows:
	(1) The Army National Guard of the United States, 336,000.
	(2) The Army Reserve, 189,500.
	(3) The Navy Reserve, 58,600.
	(4) The Marine Corps Reserve, 36,800.
	(5) The Air National Guard of the United States, 108,300.
	(6) The Air Force Reserve, 70,300.
	(7) The Coast Guard Reserve, 7,000.

	(b) End Strength Reductions.—The end strengths prescribed by subsection (a) for the Selected Reserve of any reserve component shall be proportionately reduced by—
	(1) the total authorized strength of units organized to serve as units of the Selected Reserve of such component which are on active duty (other than for training) at the end of the fiscal year; and
	(2) the total number of individual members not in units organized to serve as units of the Selected Reserve of such component who are on active duty (other than for training or for unsatisfactory participation in training) without their consent at the...

	(c) End Strength Increases.—Whenever units or individual members of the Selected Reserve for any reserve component are released from active duty during any fiscal year, the end strength prescribed for such fiscal year for the Selected Reserve of such ...

	Sec. 412. End strengths for reserves on active duty in support of the reserves.
	Within the end strengths prescribed in section 411(a), the reserve components of the Armed Forces are authorized, as of September 30, 2022, the following number of Reserves to be serving on full-time active duty or full-time duty, in the case of membe...
	(1) The Army National Guard of the United States, 30,845.
	(2) The Army Reserve, 16,511.
	(3) The Navy Reserve, 10,293.
	(4) The Marine Corps Reserve, 2,386.
	(5) The Air National Guard of the United States, 26,662.
	(6) The Air Force Reserve, 6,003.


	Sec. 413. End strengths for military technicians (dual status).
	The minimum number of military technicians (dual status) as of the last day of fiscal year 2022 for the reserve components of the Army and the Air Force (notwithstanding section 129 of title 10, United States Code) shall be the following:
	(1) For the Army National Guard of the United States, 22,294.
	(2) For the Army Reserve, 6,492.
	(3) For the Air National Guard of the United States, 9,885.
	(4) For the Air Force Reserve, 7,111.


	Sec. 414. Maximum number of reserve personnel authorized to be on active duty for operational support.
	During fiscal year 2022, the maximum number of members of the reserve components of the Armed Forces who may be serving at any time on full-time operational support duty under section 115(b) of title 10, United States Code, is the following:
	(1) The Army National Guard of the United States, 17,000.
	(2) The Army Reserve, 13,000.
	(3) The Navy Reserve, 6,200.
	(4) The Marine Corps Reserve, 3,000.
	(5) The Air National Guard of the United States, 16,000.
	(6) The Air Force Reserve, 14,000.



	Subtitle C—Authorization of Appropriations
	Sec. 421. Military personnel.
	There is hereby authorized to be appropriated for military personnel for fiscal year 2022 a total of $157,947,920,000.


	TITLE V—MILITARY PERSONNEL POLICY
	Sec. 501. Employment authority for civilian faculty at certain military department schools.
	(a) Addition of Army University and Additional Faculty.—
	(1) In general.—Section 7371 of title 10, United States Code, is amended—
	(A) in subsection (a)—
	(i) by inserting “academic faculty,” before “and lecturers”; and
	(ii) by striking “the Army War College or the United States Army Command and General Staff College” and inserting “the Army War College, the United States Army Command and General Staff College, and the Army University”; and

	(B) by striking subsection (c).

	(2) Conforming amendments.—
	(A) Section heading.—Section 7371 of such title is amended by striking the section designation and heading and inserting the following:


	“§ 7371. Army War College, United States Army Command and General Staff College, and Army University: civilian faculty members”.
	(B) Table of sections.—The table of sections at the beginning of chapter 747 of such title is amended by striking the item relating to section 7371 and inserting the following:

	(b) Addition of Naval University System Institutions and Additional Faculty.—
	(1) In general.—Section 8748 of such title is amended—
	(A) in subsection (a)—
	(i) by inserting “academic faculty,” before “and lecturers”; and
	(i) by striking “the Naval War College or of the Marine Corps University” and inserting “the Naval War College, the Marine Corps University, or other Naval University System institutions”; and

	(B) by striking subsection (c).
	(2) Conforming amendments.—
	(A) Section heading.—Section 8748 of such title is amended by striking the section designation and heading and inserting the following:


	“§ 8748. Naval War College, Marine Corps University, and other Naval University System institutions: civilian faculty members”.
	(B) Table of sections.—The table of sections at the beginning of chapter 871 of such title is amended by striking the item relating to section 8748 and inserting the following:

	(c) Air University.—Section 9371 of such title is amended—
	(1) in subsection (a), by inserting “academic faculty,” before “and lecturers”; and
	(2) by striking subsection (c).


	Sec. 502. Amendments to additional Deputy Inspector General of the Department of Defense.
	Section 554(a) of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2021 (Public Law 116-283) is amended—
	(1) in the section heading, by striking “Deputy” and inserting “Assistant”;
	(2) in paragraph (1)—
	(A) in the matter preceding subparagraph (A)—
	(i)  by striking “Secretary of Defense” and inserting “Inspector General of the Department of Defense”; and
	(ii)  by striking “Deputy” and inserting “Assistant”;

	(B) in subparagraph (A), by striking “of the Department”; and
	(C) in subparagraph (B), by striking “report directly to and serve” and inserting “be”;

	(3) in paragraph (2)—
	(A) in the matter preceding clause (i) of  subparagraph (A)—
	(i) by striking  “Conducting and supervising” and inserting “Developing and carrying out a plan for the conduct of comprehensive oversight, including through the conduct and supervision of”; and
	(ii)  by striking “evaluations” and inserting “inspections,”;

	(B) in clause (ii) of subparagraph (A), by striking “, including the duties of the Inspector General under subsection (b)”; and
	(C) in subparagraph (B), by striking “Secretary or”;

	(4) in paragraph (3), in the matter preceding subparagraph (A), by striking “Deputy” and inserting “Assistant”;
	(5) in paragraph (4)—
	(A) in subparagraph (A), by striking “Deputy” each place it appears and inserting “Assistant”;
	(B) in subparagraph (B)—
	(i) by striking “Deputy” the first place it appears;
	(ii) by striking “and the Inspector General”;
	(iii) by striking “Deputy” the second place it appears and inserting “Assistant”; and
	(iv) by inserting before the period at the end the following: “, for inclusion in the next semiannual report of the Inspector General under section 5 of the Inspector General Act of 1978 (5 U.S.C. App.).”;

	(C) in subparagraph (C)—
	(i) by striking “Deputy”; and
	(ii) by striking “and Inspector General”;

	(D) in subparagraph (D)—
	(i) by striking “Deputy”;
	(ii) by striking “and the Inspector General”;
	(iii) by striking  “Secretary or”; and
	(iv) by striking “direct” and inserting “determine”; and

	(E) in subparagraph (E)—
	(i) by striking “Deputy” ; and
	(ii) by striking “of the Department” and all that follows through “Representatives”  and inserting “consistent with the requirements of the Inspector General Act of 1978 (5 U.S.C. App.).”.





	TITLE VI—COMPENSATION AND OTHER PERSONNEL BENEFITS
	Sec. 601. Extension of expiring title 37 authorities.
	(a) Lodging in Kind For Reserve Component Members Performing Training.—
	(1) In general.—Section 12604 of title 10, United States Code, is amended by adding at the end the following new subsection:

	“(c) Lodging in Kind.—(1) In the case of a member of a reserve component performing active duty for training or inactive-duty training who is not otherwise entitled to travel and transportation allowances in connection with such duty, the Secretary co...
	“(2) Any payment or other benefit under this subsection shall be provided in accordance with regulations prescribed by the Secretary concerned.
	“(3) The Secretary may pay service charge expenses under paragraph (1) and expenses of providing lodging in kind under such paragraph out of funds appropriated for operation and maintenance for the reserve component concerned. Use of a Government char...
	“(4) Decisions regarding the availability or adequacy of government housing at a military installation under paragraph (1) shall be made by the installation commander.”.
	(2) Repeal.—Section 474(i) of title 37, United States Code, is repealed.

	(b) Mandatory Pet Quarantine Fees for Household Pets.—Section 451(b)(8) of title 37, United States Code, is amended by adding at the end the following: “Such costs include pet quarantine expenses.”.
	(c) Student Dependent Transportation.—
	(1) In general.—Section 452(b) of title 37, United States Code, is amended by adding at the end the following new paragraphs:
	“(18) Travel by a dependent child to the United States to obtain formal secondary, undergraduate, graduate, or vocational education, if the permanent duty assignment location of the member of the uniformed services is outside the continental United St...
	“(19) Travel by a dependent child within the United States to obtain formal secondary, undergraduate, graduate, or vocational education, if the permanent duty assignment location of the member of the uniformed services is in Alaska or Hawaii and the s...

	(2) Definitions.—Section 451 of title 37, United States Code, is amended—
	(A) in subsection (a)(2)(H), by adding at the end the following new clauses:
	“(vii) Transportation of a dependent child of a member of the uniformed services to the United States to obtain formal secondary, undergraduate, graduate, or vocational education, if the permanent duty assignment location of the member is outside the ...
	“(viii) Transportation of a dependent child of a member of the uniformed services within the United States to obtain formal secondary, undergraduate, graduate, or vocational education, if the permanent duty assignment location of the member is in Alas...

	(B) in subsection (b), by adding at the end the following new paragraph:
	“(10)(A) The term ‘permanent duty assignment location’ means—
	“(i) the official station of a member of the uniformed services; or
	“(ii) the residence of a dependent of a member of the uniformed services.

	“(B) As used in subparagraph (A)(ii), the residence of a dependent who is a student not living with the member while at school is the permanent duty assignment location of the dependent student.”.

	(d) Dependent Transportation Incident to Ship Construction, Inactivation, and Overhauling.—
	(1) In general.—Section 452 of title 37, United States Code, as amended by subsection (c) of this section, is further amended—
	(A) in subsection (b), by adding at the end the following new paragraph:

	“(20) Subject to subsection (i), travel by a dependent to a location where a member of the uniformed services is on permanent duty aboard a ship that is overhauling, inactivating, or under construction.”; and
	(B) by adding at the end the following new subsection:


	“(i) Dependent Transportation Incident to Ship Construction, Inactivation, and Overhauling.—The authority under subsection (a) for travel in connection with circumstances described in subsection (b)(19) shall be subject to the following terms and cond...
	“(1) The Service member must be permanently assigned to the ship for 31 or more consecutive days to be eligible for allowances, and the transportation allowances accrue on the 31st day and every 60 days thereafter.
	“(2) Transportation in kind, reimbursement for personally procured transportation, or a monetary allowance for mileage in place of the cost of transportation may be provided, in lieu of the member’s entitlement to transportation, for the member’s depe...
	“(3) The total reimbursement for transportation for the member’s dependents may not exceed the cost of one Government-procured commercial round-trip travel.”.
	(2) Definitions.—Section 451(a)(2)(H) of title 37, United States Code, as amended by subsection (c) of this section, is further amended by adding at the end the following new clause:
	“(ix) Transportation of a dependent to a location where a member of the uniformed services is on permanent duty aboard a ship that is overhauling, inactivating, or under construction.”.



	Sec. 602. Additional sources of funds available for construction, repair, improvement, and maintenance of commissary stores.
	Section 2484(h) of title 10, United States Code, is amended—
	(1) in paragraph (5), by adding at the end the following new subparagraphs:
	“(F) Contributions for any purpose set forth in paragraph (1) in connection with a host nation country-to-country agreement.
	“(G) Amounts appropriated for repair or reconstruction of a commissary store in response to a disaster or emergency.”; and
	(2) by adding at the end the following new paragraph:

	“(6) In addition to the revenues specified in paragraph (5) deposited into the account used for commissary store surcharge collections, amounts may be transferred to such account from the following sources and used for the purposes set forth in paragr...
	“(A) Balances in nonappropriated and appropriated fund accounts of the Department of Defense, including Defense Working Capital Fund accounts, derived from improved management practices implemented pursuant to sections 2481(c)(3), 2485(b), and 2487(c)...
	“(B) Balances in Defense Working Capital Fund commissary operations accounts derived from the variable pricing program implemented pursuant to subsection (i).”.



	TITLE VII— HEALTH CARE PROVISIONS
	Sec. 701. Repeal of requirement to transfer research and development functions to Defense Health Agency.
	Section 1073c of title 10, United States Code, is amended––
	(1) by striking subsection (e) and inserting the following new subsection:

	“(e) Additional DHA Organization.—Not later than September 30, 2022, the Secretary of Defense, acting through the Director of the Defense Health Agency, shall establish within the Defense Health Agency a subordinate organization, to be called the Defe...
	“(1) led, at the election of the Director, by a director or commander (to be called the Director or Commander of Defense Health Agency Public Health); and
	“(2) comprised of elements of the Army Public Health Center, the Navy–Marine Corps Public Health Command, Air Force public health programs, and any other related defense health activities that the Secretary considers appropriate, including overseas la...
	(2) by redesignating subsection (g) as subsection (h); and
	(3) by inserting after subsection (f) the following new subsection:

	“(g) Medical Research Organizations and Activities.—The Secretary of Defense, acting through the Secretaries of the military departments, shall ensure that each military department maintains department specific medical research organizations and activ...


	TITLE VIII— ACQUISITION POLICY, ACQUISITION MANAGEMENT, AND RELATED MATTERS
	Sec. 801. Authority to acquire and dispose of materials for the National Defense Stockpile.
	(a) Disposal Authority.—Pursuant to section 5(b) of the Strategic and Critical Materials Stock Piling Act (50 U.S.C. 98d(b)), the National Defense Stockpile Manager may dispose of 4,031,000 pounds of tungsten ores and concentrates contained in the Nat...
	(b) Acquisition Authority.—Using funds available in the National Defense Stockpile Transaction Fund, the National Defense Stockpile Manager may acquire the following materials determined to be strategic and critical materials required to meet the defe...
	(1) Neodymium oxide, Praseodymium oxide, and Neodymium Iron Boron (NdFeB) magnet block.
	(2) Trinitrotoluene (TNT) or Substitute Materials.
	(3) Titanium.

	(c) Amount of Authority.—The National Defense Stockpile Manager may use up to $50,000,000 in the National Defense Stockpile Transaction Fund for acquisition of the materials specified in subsection (b).
	(d) Fiscal Year Limitation.—The authority under subsection (b) is available for purchases during fiscal year 2022 through fiscal year 2031.

	Sec. 802. Removing barriers to, and extension of, the Defense Production Act.
	(a) Presidential Actions.—Section 303(a) of the Defense Production Act (50 U.S.C. 4533(a)) is amended—
	(1) in paragraph (5), in the matter preceding subparagraph (A), by striking “on a nondelegable basis” and inserting “or the Secretary of Defense if so delegated”; and
	(2) in paragraph (6), by striking subparagraph (C).


	Sec. 803. Modification and extension of authority for pilot program for development of technology-enhanced capabilities with partnership intermediaries.
	(a) Modification. —Section 851(a) of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2020 (Public Law 116-92; 133 Stat. 1510; 10 U.S.C. 2283 note)  is amended—
	(1) by striking “The Commander” and inserting “The Secretary of Defense may authorize the Commander”; and
	(2) by striking “the greater of $2,000,000 or 5 percent of the funds required to be expended by the United States Special Operations Command” and inserting “up to $20,000,000 of the funds available to be expended by the United States Special Operation...



	TITLE IX—[RESERVED]
	TITLE X—GENERAL PROVISIONS
	Sec. 1001. Information required to comply with policy on response to juvenile-on-juvenile problematic sexual behavior committed on military installations.
	Section 1089 of the John S. McCain National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2019 (10 U.S.C. 1781 note; 132 Stat. 1996) is amended by adding at the end the following new subsection:
	“(c) Provision of Certain Information.—(1) The provision of information from a juvenile delinquency proceeding, including any associated law enforcement investigation, for purposes of compliance with the policy required under this section, shall be tr...
	“(2) In this subsection, the term ‘juvenile delinquency’ has the meaning given that term in section 5031 of title 18, United States Code.”.

	Sec. 1002. Nondisclosure of certain sensitive military information.
	(a) Section Heading.—The heading of section 130e of title 10, United States Code, is amended to read as follows:
	“§130e. Nondisclosure of certain sensitive military information”.
	(b) Exemption.—Section 130e(a) of title 10, Unites States Code, is amended—
	(1) in the matter preceding paragraph (1)—
	(A) by striking “critical infrastructure security”; and
	(B) by striking “pursuant to section 552(b)(3) of title 5,”; and

	(2) by amending paragraph (1) to read as follows:
	“(1) the information is—
	“(A) Department of Defense critical infrastructure security information;
	“(B) covered military tactic, technique, or procedure information; or
	“(C) covered rule of engagement or rule for the use of force information; and”.


	(c) Designation of Department of Defense Information.—Section 130e(b) of such title is amended—
	(1) in the subsection heading, by striking “Critical Infrastructure Security”; and
	(2) in the first sentence, by striking “may designate information as being Department of Defense critical infrastructure security information” and inserting “may designate information as being information identified in subsection (a)(1)”.

	(d) Information Provided to State and Local Governments.—Section 130e(c) of such title is amended—
	(1) in paragraphs (1) and (2)(A), by striking “critical infrastructure security”; and
	(2) in paragraph (2)(B), by striking “Department of Defense critical infrastructure security information” and inserting “information exempt from disclosure”.

	(e) Delegation and Transparency.—Section 130e of such title is further amended—
	(1) by striking subsection (d);
	(2) by redesignating subsection (e) as subsection (d); and
	(3) in subsection (d), as so redesignated—
	(A) by striking “, or the Secretary’s designee,”; and
	(B) by striking “, upon request, through the Office of the Director of Administration and Management” and inserting “in accordance with guidelines prescribed by the Secretary”.
	(f) Citation for Purposes of OPEN FOIA Act of 2009.—Section 130e of such title is further amended by inserting after subsection (d), as redesignated by subsection (e)(2) of this section, the following new subsection:

	“(e) Citation for Purposes of OPEN FOIA Act of 2009.—This section shall be treated as a statute that specifically exempts certain matters from disclosure under section 552 of title 5, as described in subsection (b)(3) of that section.”.
	(g) Definitions.—Subsection (f) of such section is amended to read as follows:
	“(f) Definitions.—In this section:

	“(1) Adversary.—The term ‘adversary’ means a party acknowledged as potentially hostile to a friendly party and against which the use of force may be envisaged.
	“(2) Covered military tactic, technique, or procedure information.—The term ‘covered military tactic, technique, or procedure information’ means information that would reveal or consists of a military tactic, technique, or procedure that identifies a ...
	“(3) Covered rule of engagement or rule for the use of force information.—The term ‘covered rule of engagement or rule for the use of force information’ means information that would reveal or consists of a rule of engagement or rule for the use of for...
	“(4) Department of defense critical infrastructure security information.—The term ‘Department of Defense critical infrastructure security information’ means sensitive but unclassified information that, if disclosed, would reveal capabilities or vulner...
	“(A) information regarding the securing and safeguarding of explosives, hazardous chemicals, or pipelines, related to critical infrastructure or protected equipment and systems owned or operated by or on behalf of the Department of Defense;
	“(B) vulnerability assessments prepared by or on behalf of the Department of Defense;
	“(C) explosives safety information, including storage and handling; and
	“(D) other site-specific information on or relating to installation security.
	“(5) Military tactic, technique, or procedure.—The term ‘military tactic, technique, or procedure’ means—
	“(A) the employment and ordered arrangement of military forces in relation to each other;
	“(B) a non-prescriptive way or method used to perform a mission, function, or task that is—
	“(i) related to or incidental to a combat mission or contingency operation; or
	“(ii) directly related to preparing for, going to, or returning from a combat mission or contingency operation; or
	“(C) detailed steps that prescribe how to perform a specific task that is—
	“(i) related to, or incidental to, a combat mission, force protection operation, or contingency operation; or
	“(ii) directly related to preparing for, going to, or returning from a combat mission, force protection operation, or contingency operation.
	“(6) Rule for the use of force.—The term ‘rule for the use of force’ means a directive issued to guide armed forces on the use of force during various operations.
	“(7) Rule of engagement.—The term ‘rule of engagement’ means a directive issued by a competent military authority that delineates the circumstances and limitations under which the armed forces will initiate or continue combat engagement with other for...

	(i) Clerical Amendment.—The item relating to section 130e in the table of sections at the beginning of chapter 3 of such title is amended to read as follows:


	TITLE XI— CIVILIAN PERSONNEL MATTERS
	Sec. 1101. One-year extension of authority to waive annual limitation on premium pay and aggregate limitation on pay for Federal civilian employees working overseas.
	Subsection (a) of section 1101 of the Duncan Hunter National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2009 (Public Law 110-417; 122 Stat. 4615), as most recently amended by section 1105 of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry National Defense Authorizatio...

	Sec. 1102. One-year extension of temporary authority to grant allowances, benefits, and gratuities to civilian personnel on official duty in a combat zone.
	Paragraph (2) of section 1603(a) of the Emergency Supplemental Appropriations Act for Defense, the Global War on Terror, and Hurricane Recovery, 2006 (Public Law 109-234; 120 Stat. 443), as added by section 1102 of the Duncan Hunter National Defense A...


	TITLE XII— MATTERS RELATING TO FOREIGN NATIONS
	Sec. 1201. Extension and modification of authority for reimbursement of certain coalition nations for support provided to United States military operations.
	(a) Extension.—Subsection (a) of section 1233 of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2008 (Public Law 110-181; 122 Stat. 393), as most recently amended by section 1211 of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry National Defense Authorizatio...
	(b) Modification to Limitations.—Subsection (d)(1) of such section is amended—
	(1) by striking “beginning on October 1, 2020, and ending on December 31, 2021” and inserting “beginning on October 1, 2021, and ending on December 31, 2022”; and
	(2) by striking “$180,000,000” and inserting “$160,000,000”.


	Sec. 1202. Afghanistan Security Forces Fund.
	(a) Continuation of Prior Authorities and Notice and Reporting Requirements.—Funds available to the Department of Defense for the Afghanistan Security Forces Fund for fiscal year 2022 shall be subject to the conditions contained in—
	(1) subsections (b) through (f) of section 1513 of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2008 (Public Law 110-181; 122 Stat. 428); and
	(2) section 1521(d)(1) of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2017 (Public Law 114-328; 130 Stat. 2577).

	(b) Use of Funds.—
	(1) Ministry of defense advisors.—Subsection (b)(1) of such section 1513 is amended by inserting before the period the following: “, including costs of Department of Defense personnel who advise those Ministries”.
	(2) Type of assistance.—Subsection (b)(2) of such section 1513 is amended by inserting “(including program and security assistance management support)” after “services”.

	(c) Equipment Disposition.—
	(1) Acceptance of certain equipment.—Subject to paragraph (2), the Secretary of Defense may accept equipment that is procured using amounts authorized to be appropriated for the Afghanistan Security Forces Fund by this Act and is intended for transfe...
	(2) Conditions on acceptance of equipment.—Before accepting any equipment under the authority provided by paragraph (1), the Commander of United States forces in Afghanistan shall make a determination that such equipment was procured for the purpose o...
	(3) Elements of determination.—In making a determination under paragraph (2) regarding equipment, the Commander of United States forces in Afghanistan shall consider alternatives to acceptance of such equipment by the Secretary of Defense.
	(4) Treatment as Department of Defense stocks.—Equipment accepted under the authority provided by paragraph (1) may be treated as stocks of the Department of Defense upon notification to the congressional defense committees of such treatment.

	(d) Reimbursable Transaction Authority for Ch-47 Helicopters.—
	(1) Authority.—The Secretary of Defense may use amounts authorized for the Afghanistan Security Forces Fund in this Act or the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2021 to purchase CH-47 Chinook helicopters from the Secretary of the Army.
	(2) Reimbursement Amount.—The Secretary of Defense shall reimburse the Secretary of the Army for the full replacement value of the helicopters purchased in each transaction made under the authority of paragraph (1).


	Sec. 1203. Extension of Department of Defense support for reconciliation activities led by the Government of Afghanistan.
	Section 1218(k) of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2020 (Public Law 116-92), as most recently amended by section 1213 of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2021 (Public Law 116-2...

	Sec. 1204. Extension and modification of authority to provide assistance to vetted Syrian groups and individuals.
	(a) Extension.—Subsection (a) of section 1209 of the Carl Levin and Howard P. “Buck” McKeon National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2015 (Public Law 113–291; 128 Stat. 3559), as most recently amended by section 1222 of the William M. (Mac) ...
	(b) Accounting of Expenditures.—Such section 1209 is further amended—
	(1) by striking subsections (b) and (c);
	(2) by redesignating subsections (d) through (m) as subsections (b) through (k), respectively; and
	(3) in paragraph (2) of subsection (b) (as redesignated by paragraph (2) of this subsection)—
	(A) by redesignating subclause (I) of subparagraph (J)(iii) as subparagraph (K) and conforming the margins accordingly; and
	(B) by adding at the end the following new subparagraph:
	“(L) An accounting of the funds expended to provide assistance under subsection (a).”.


	(c) Limitation on Cost of Construction and Repair Projects.—Subsection (j) of such section 1209, as redesignated by subsection (b)(2) of this section, is further amended—
	(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “may not exceed” and all that follows and inserting “in any fiscal year may not exceed $20,000,000 in the aggregate.”; and
	(2) in paragraph (2), by striking “per-project or aggregate”.


	Sec. 1205. Extension of authority to provide assistance to counter the Islamic State of Iraq and Syria.
	(a) Extension.—Subsection (a) of section 1236 of the Carl Levin and Howard P. “Buck” McKeon National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2015 (Public Law 113–291; 128 Stat. 3559), as most recently amended by section 1221 of the William M. (Mac) ...
	(b) Funding.—Subsection (g) of such section 1236 is amended—
	(1) by striking “Overseas Contingency Operations for fiscal year 2021” and inserting “fiscal year 2022”; and
	(2) by striking “$322,500,000” and inserting “$345,000,000”.

	(c) Cost-Sharing Requirement.—Subsection (k)(1) of such section 1236 is amended—
	(1) by striking “60 percent” and inserting “75 percent”;
	(2) by striking “40 percent” and inserting “30 percent”; and
	(3) by striking “50 percent” and inserting “25 percent”.

	(d) Assessment.—Subsection (l)(1)(B) of such section 1236 is amended—
	(1) by striking clause (ii);
	(2) by redesignating clauses (iii) through (vii) as clauses (ii) through (vi), respectively; and
	(3) in clause (iv), as redesignated by paragraph (2) of this subsection, by striking “, and, once established, the Iraqi Sunni National Guard”.

	(e) Limitation on Aggregate Cost of Construction, Repair, and Renovation Projects.—Subsection (m) of such section 1236 is amended—
	(1) by striking “Renovation Projects.—The aggregate” and inserting the following: “Renovation Projects.—
	“(1) In general.—The aggregate”; and
	(2) by adding at the end the following new paragraph:
	“(2) Foreign contributions.—The limitation under paragraph (1) shall not apply to the expenditure of foreign contributions in excess of the limitation set forth in that paragraph.”.


	Sec. 1206. Extension of authority to support operations and activities of the Office of Security Cooperation in Iraq.
	(a) Extension.—Subsections (c) and (d) of section 1215 of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2012 (10 U.S.C. 113 note), as most recently amended by section 1223 of the William M. (Mac) Thornberry National Defense Authorization Act ...
	(b) Funding Limitation.—Subsection (c) of such section 1215, as amended by subsection (a) of this section, is further amended by striking “$25,000,000” and inserting “$30,000,000”.


	TITLE XIII—[RESERVED]
	TITLE XIV—OTHER AUTHORIZATIONS
	Subtitle A—Military Programs
	Sec. 1401. Working capital funds.
	Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 for the use of the Armed Forces and other activities and agencies of the Department of Defense for providing capital for working capital and revolving funds in the amount of $1,902,00...

	Sec. 1402. Chemical agents and munitions destruction, defense.
	(a) Authorization of Appropriations.—Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for the Department of Defense for fiscal year 2022 for expenses, not otherwise provided for, for Chemical Agents and Munitions Destruction, Defense, in the amount of $...
	(1) $93,121,000 is for Operation and Maintenance; and
	(2) $1,001,231,000 is for Research, Development, Test, and Evaluation.

	(b) Use.—Amounts authorized to be appropriated under subsection (a) are authorized for—
	(1) the destruction of lethal chemical agents and munitions in accordance with section 1412 of the Department of Defense Authorization Act, 1986 (50 U.S.C. 1521); and
	(2) the destruction of chemical warfare materiel of the United States that is not covered by section 1412 of such Act.


	Sec. 1403. Drug interdiction and counter-drug activities, defense.
	Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for the Department of Defense for fiscal year 2022 for expenses, not otherwise provided for, for Drug Interdiction and Counter-Drug Activities, Defense, in the amount of $821,908,000.

	Sec. 1404. Defense Inspector General.
	Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for the Department of Defense for fiscal year 2022 for expenses, not otherwise provided for, for the Office of the Inspector General of the Department of Defense, in the amount of $438,363,000 of which—

	Sec. 1405. Defense Health Program.
	Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for the Department of Defense for fiscal year 2022 for expenses, not otherwise provided for, for the Defense Health Program, in the amount of $35,592,408,000 of which—
	(1) $34,182,719,000 is for Operation and Maintenance;
	(2) $630,681,000 is for Research, Development, Test, and Evaluation; and
	(3) $779,008,000 is for Procurement.



	Subtitle B—Other Matters
	Sec. 1411. Authority for transfer of funds to joint Department of Defense-Department of Veterans Affairs medical facility demonstration fund for Captain James A. Lovell Health Care Center, Illinois.
	(a) Authority for Transfer of Funds.—Of the funds authorized to be appropriated for section 1405 and available for the Defense Health Program for operation and maintenance, $137,000,000 may be transferred by the Secretary of Defense to the Joint Depar...
	(b) Use of Transferred Funds.—For the purposes of subsection (b) of such section 1704, facility operations for which funds transferred under subsection (a) may be used are operations of the Captain James A. Lovell Federal Health Care Center, consistin...

	Sec. 1412. Authorization of appropriations for Armed Forces Retirement Home.
	There is hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2022 from the Armed Forces Retirement Home Trust Fund the sum of $75,300,000 for the operation of the Armed Forces Retirement Home.


	TITLE XV—[RESERVED]
	TITLE XVI— STRATEGIC PROGRAMS, CYBER, AND INTELLIGENCE MATTERS
	Sec. 1601. Authority of Army counterintelligence agents.
	(a) Authority To Execute Warrants and Make Arrests.—Section 7377 of title 10, United States Code, is amended—
	(1) in the section heading, by inserting “and Army Counterintelligence Command” before the colon”; and
	(2) in subsection (b)—
	(A) by striking “any employee of the Department of the Army who is” and inserting the following: “any employee of the Department of the Army—

	“(1) who is”;
	(B) in paragraph (1) (as so designated) by striking the period at the end and inserting “; or”; and
	(C) by adding at the end the following new paragraph:

	“(2) who is a special agent of the Army Counterintelligence Command (or a successor to that command) whose duties include conducting, supervising, or coordinating counterintelligence investigations involving potential or alleged violations punishable ...

	(b) Clerical Amendment.—The table of sections at the beginning of chapter 747 of such title is amended by striking the item relating to section 7377 and inserting the following new item:

	Sec. 1602. Extension of transition of ballistic missile defense programs to the military departments.
	Section 1676(b)(1) of  the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2018 (P.L. 115-91; 10 U.S.C. 2431 note) is amended by striking “2023” and inserting “2024”.


	DIVISION B— MILITARY CONSTRUCTION AUTHORIZATIONS
	TITLE XXI–[RESERVED]
	TITLE XXII–[RESERVED]
	TITLE XXIII–[RESERVED]
	TITLE XXIV–[RESERVED]
	TITLE XXV–[RESERVED]
	TITLE XXVI–[RESERVED]
	TITLE XXVII–[RESERVED]
	TITLE XXVIII–MILITARY CONSTRUCTION GENERAL PROVISIONS
	Sec. 2801.  Removal of sunset provision from authority to exempt Department of Defense non-mobile properties from certain excess property disposal requirements.
	Section 2822 of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2019 (42 U.S.C. 11411 note; Public Law 115-232) is amended by striking subsection (d).

	Sec. 2802. Modification of statutory cost thresholds for authority to acquire low-cost interests in land.
	Section 2663(c) of title 10, United States Code, is amended—
	(1) in paragraph (1)(B), by striking “$750,000” and inserting “$6,000,000”;
	(2) by striking paragraph (2);
	(3) by redesignating paragraphs (3) and (4) as paragraphs (2) and (3), respectively; and
	(4) in paragraph (2), as redesignated by paragraph (3) of this section, by striking “unless the total cost is not more than $750,000, in the case of an acquisition under paragraph (1), or $1,500,000, in the case of an acquisition under paragraph (2)” ...




