
For the best experience, open this PDF portfolio in
 
Acrobat X or Adobe Reader X, or later.
 

Get Adobe Reader Now! 

http://www.adobe.com/go/reader




1 


SEC. 547.  AUTHORITY FOR APPLICATIONS FOR CORRECTION OF MILITARY 1 


RECORDS TO BE INITIATED BY SECRETARY CONCERNED.  2 


Section 1552(b) of title 10, United States Code, is amended― 3 


(1) by striking “or his heir or legal representative” and inserting “(or the claimant’s 4 


heir or legal representative) or the Secretary concerned”; and 5 


(2) by striking “he discovers” and inserting “discovering”.  6 


Section-by-Section Analysis 
 


 This proposal would allow the Secretaries of the military departments to apply for a 
correction to military records on behalf of an unrepresented individual who cannot file on his or 
her own behalf or on behalf of a group of service members or veterans identically impacted by a 
Service’s action or inaction. 
 
 Congress created the Boards for the Correction of Military Records (BCMRs) to 
eliminate the need for Congress and the President to enact private bills to correct military records 
that contained errors or resulted in injustices. In the past, the Army Board for Correction of 
Military Records (ABCMR) has decided cases affecting large groups of soldiers or veterans 
identically impacted by Army errors.  The Army could not otherwise correct the errors without 
enlisting the extraordinary authority of the ABCMR or seeking legislative relief.  The Army 
sought relief from the ABCMR because the Board could react more quickly than Congress or 
because the problem was a one-time occurrence that did not necessitate corrective legislation for 
future occasions.  However, each soldier or veteran had to file an individual application to 
authorize the ABCMR to act in his or her case.  The ABCMR has also had cases where it wanted 
to correct an error or injustice, but was unable to do so because it could not locate a veteran, or 
an individual authorized to represent the veteran, who could then file an application for relief that 
the ABCMR was already prepared to provide. 
 
 Three examples will illustrate the problem to be addressed.  In the first set of cases, 
approximately 2,000 National Guard members were inadvertently disadvantaged for 
Montgomery GI Bill benefits by the manner in which the Army extended their mobilizations.  
These deployed Guard members did not qualify for the more beneficial active duty Montgomery 
GI Bill, although they had served the requisite period of continuous active duty.  The Army 
wanted to correct the unintended consequences of its action, but lacked the authority to do so 
unless it employed the ABCMRs jurisdiction to correct errors and injustices.  However, the 
BCMRs currently can act only in response to an application from the affected individual, his or 
her heir, or legal representative.  The Secretary concerned cannot file an application on behalf of 
an individual.  Accordingly, the Army spent considerable resources briefing Guard members and 
obtaining their individual applications.  The ABCMR also spent considerable resources 
processing the individual applications.   
 







2 


 As a second example in another set of cases, the ABCMR granted relief to a handful of 
veterans who the Army unfairly convicted at a joint court-martial during World War II.  
Unfortunately, the Army could not locate the remainder of the 28 convicted veterans (or their 
heirs) to advise them of the availability of the ABCMR process to clear their records.  Allowing 
the Secretary concerned to act on behalf of members of a group similarly affected and/or on 
behalf of an unrepresented individual who cannot file on his or her own behalf would have 
provided a more effective and efficient method of granting relief to all parties who had been 
disadvantaged by the Army’s action.   
 
 As a third example, the ABCMR currently is processing cases involving former soldiers 
who requested separation pay pursuant to section 1174 of title 10, United States Code, based 
upon their agreement to serve in the Ready Reserve.  Despite a request by the Army, DFAS 
refused to make the separation payments because the Army failed to have the soldiers execute 
the proper form.  Approximately 200 former soldiers were impacted by this oversight.  Army G-
1 supports granting these former soldiers relief through a correction showing that they executed 
the proper paperwork to receive the separation pay.  However, in order to do so, the ABCMR 
must obtain applications from each affected former soldier.   
 
 This proposal would permit the Services’ BCMRs, using procedures approved by the 
Secretary of Defense, to correct an injustice for an individual or class of individual service 
members or veterans.  The proposal would enable the BCMRs to more efficiently take corrective 
action for known injustices or errors. 
 
Budget Implications:  There are no funding implications for this proposal.  A change in the law 
would have no increased financial implications as the Service BCMRs under current law would 
still have to process the cases of each individual applicant.  In fact, a service initiated application 
to its respective BCMR would create efficiencies by corrections of errors for many similarly 
situated applicants in one or a limited number of cases rather than on an individual basis.  
 
It is hard to estimate the number of individuals affected because we have no way of anticipating 
when common errors affecting a large group of current or former soldiers will arise.  As noted 
above, we currently have a scenario affecting about 200 former soldiers who could have 
benefitted from the proposed change to the law.  However, even where common errors are 
identified that affect a group of current or former soldiers, the amendment to the law would be 
invoked only under procedures specified by the Office of the Secretary of Defense (OSD) and 
the military departments.   
 


RESOURCE REQUIREMENTS ($MILLIONS) 


 FY 
2016 


FY 
2017 


FY 
2018 


FY 
2019 


FY 
2020 


Appropriation 
From 


Budget 
Activity 


Dash-1 
Line 
Item 


Program 
Element 


 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00     
Total 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00     


 
Change to Existing Law:  This proposal would make the following change to section 1552 of 
title 10, United States Code: 
 







3 


§1552. Correction of military records: claims incident thereto 
(a)(1) The Secretary of a military department may correct any military record of the 


Secretary's department when the Secretary considers it necessary to correct an error or remove an 
injustice. Except as provided in paragraph (2), such corrections shall be made by the Secretary 
acting through boards of civilians of the executive part of that military department. The Secretary 
of Homeland Security may in the same manner correct any military record of the Coast Guard. 


(2) The Secretary concerned is not required to act through a board in the case of the 
correction of a military record announcing a decision that a person is not eligible to enlist (or 
reenlist) or is not accepted for enlistment (or reenlistment) or announcing the promotion and 
appointment of an enlisted member to an initial or higher grade or the decision not to promote an 
enlisted member to a higher grade. Such a correction may be made only if the correction is 
favorable to the person concerned. 


(3) Corrections under this section shall be made under procedures established by the 
Secretary concerned. In the case of the Secretary of a military department, those procedures must 
be approved by the Secretary of Defense. 


(4) Except when procured by fraud, a correction under this section is final and conclusive 
on all officers of the United States. 


(b) No correction may be made under subsection (a)(1) unless the claimant or his heir or 
legal representative(or the claimant’s heir or legal representative) or the Secretary concerned 
files a request for the correction within three years after he discovers discovering the error or 
injustice.  However, a board established under subsection (a)(1) may excuse a failure to file 
within three years after discovery if it finds it to be in the interest of justice. 


(c)(1) The Secretary concerned may pay, from applicable current appropriations, a claim 
for the loss of pay, allowances, compensation, emoluments, or other pecuniary benefits, or for 
the repayment of a fine or forfeiture, if, as a result of correcting a record under this section, the 
amount is found to be due the claimant on account of his or another's service in the Army, Navy, 
Air Force, Marine Corps, or Coast Guard, as the case may be, or on account of his or another's 
service as a civilian employee. 


(2) If the claimant is dead, the money shall be paid, upon demand, to his legal 
representative. However, if no demand for payment is made by a legal representative, the money 
shall be paid- 


(A) to the surviving spouse, heir, or beneficiaries, in the order prescribed by the law 
applicable to that kind of payment; 


(B) if there is no such law covering order of payment, in the order set forth in section 
2771 of this title; or 


(C) as otherwise prescribed by the law applicable to that kind of payment. 
(3) A claimant's acceptance of a settlement under this section fully satisfies the claim 


concerned. This section does not authorize the payment of any claim compensated by private law 
before October 25, 1951. 


(4) If the correction of military records under this section involves setting aside a 
conviction by court-martial, the payment of a claim under this subsection in connection with the 
correction of the records shall include interest at a rate to be determined by the Secretary 
concerned, unless the Secretary determines that the payment of interest is inappropriate under the 
circumstances. If the payment of the claim is to include interest, the interest shall be calculated 
on an annual basis, and compounded, using the amount of the lost pay, allowances, 
compensation, emoluments, or other pecuniary benefits involved, and the amount of any fine or 







4 


forfeiture paid, beginning from the date of the conviction through the date on which the payment 
is made. 


(d) Applicable current appropriations are available to continue the pay, allowances, 
compensation, emoluments, and other pecuniary benefits of any person who was paid under 
subsection (c), and who, because of the correction of his military record, is entitled to those 
benefits, but for not longer than one year after the date when his record is corrected under this 
section if he is not reenlisted in, or appointed or reappointed to, the grade to which those 
payments relate. Without regard to qualifications for reenlistment, or appointment or 
reappointment, the Secretary concerned may reenlist a person in, or appoint or reappoint him to, 
the grade to which payments under this section relate. 


(e) No payment may be made under this section for a benefit to which the claimant might 
later become entitled under the laws and regulations administered by the Secretary of Veterans 
Affairs. 


(f) With respect to records of courts-martial and related administrative records pertaining to 
court-martial cases tried or reviewed under chapter 47 of this title (or under the Uniform Code of 
Military Justice (Public Law 506 of the 81st Congress)), action under subsection (a) may extend 
only to- 


(1) correction of a record to reflect actions taken by reviewing authorities under chapter 
47 of this title (or under the Uniform Code of Military Justice (Public Law 506 of the 81st 
Congress)); or 


(2) action on the sentence of a court-martial for purposes of clemency. 
(g) In this section, the term "military record" means a document or other record that 


pertains to (1) an individual member or former member of the armed forces, or (2) at the 
discretion of the Secretary of the military department concerned, any other military matter 
affecting a member or former member of the armed forces, an employee or former employee of 
that military department, or a dependent or current or former spouse of any such person. Such 
term does not include records pertaining to civilian employment matters (such as matters covered 
by title 5 and chapters 81, 83, 87, 108, 373, 605, 607, 643, and 873 of this title). 





		SEC. 547.  AUTHORITY FOR APPLICATIONS FOR CORRECTION OF MILITARY RECORDS TO BE INITIATED BY SECRETARY CONCERNED.

		Section 1552(b) of title 10, United States Code, is amended―

		(1) by striking “or his heir or legal representative” and inserting “(or the claimant’s heir or legal representative) or the Secretary concerned”; and

		(2) by striking “he discovers” and inserting “discovering”.

		Section-by-Section Analysis

		Change to Existing Law:  This proposal would make the following change to section 1552 of title 10, United States Code:

		§1552. Correction of military records: claims incident thereto








1 


SEC. 843. INNOVATION SET ASIDE PROGRAM. 1 


(a) IN GENERAL.—The Director of the Office of Management and Budget may, in 2 


consultation with the Administrator of the Small Business Administration, conduct a pilot 3 


program to increase the participation of new, innovative entities in Federal contracting through 4 


the use of innovation set-asides. 5 


(b) AUTHORITY.—Notwithstanding the competition requirements in chapter 33 of title 41, 6 


United States Code, and the set-aside requirements in section 15 of the Small Business Act (15 7 


U.S.C. 644), a Federal agency, with the concurrence of the Director, may set aside a contract 8 


award to one or more new entrant contractors. The Director shall consult with the Administrator 9 


prior to providing concurrence to the agency. 10 


(c) CONDITIONS FOR USE.—The authority provided in subsection (b) may be used under 11 


the following conditions: 12 


(1) The agency has a requirement for new methods, processes, or technologies, 13 


which may include research and development, or new applications of existing methods, 14 


processes or technologies, to improve quality, reduce costs, or both. 15 


(2) Based on market research, the agency has determined that the requirement 16 


cannot be easily provided through an existing Federal contract.   17 


(3) The agency intends either to make an award to a small business concern or to 18 


give special consideration to a small business concern before making an award to other 19 


than a small business. 20 


(4) The length of the resulting contract will not exceed 2 years. 21 


(d) NUMBER OF PILOTS.—The Director may authorize the use of up to 25 innovation set-22 


asides acquisitions.   23 







2 


(e) AWARD AMOUNT.— 1 


(1) Except as provided in paragraph (2), the amount of an award under the pilot 2 


program under this section may not exceed $2,000,000 (including any options).  3 


(2) The Director may authorize not more than 5 set-asides with an award amount 4 


greater than $2,000,000 but not greater than $5,000,000 (including any options).  5 


(f) GUIDANCE AND REPORTING.— 6 


(1) The Director shall issue guidance, as necessary, to implement the pilot 7 


program under this section.  8 


(2) Within 3 years after the date of enactment of this Act, the Director, in 9 


consultation with the Administrator, shall submit to Congress a report including the 10 


following: 11 


(A) The number of awards made under the authority of this section. 12 


(B) For each award— 13 


(i) the agency that made the award; 14 


(ii) the amount of the award; and  15 


(iii) a brief description of the award, including the nature of the 16 


requirement and the innovation produced from the award (or expected if 17 


contract performance is not completed). 18 


(g) SUNSET.—The authority to award an innovation set-aside under this section shall 19 


terminate on December 31, 2019. 20 


(h) DEFINITION.—For purposes of this section, the term “new entrant contractor”, with 21 


respect to any contract under the program, means an entity that has not been awarded a contract 22 







3 


directly by the Federal Government within the 5-year period ending on the date on which a 1 


solicitation for that contract is issued under the program. 2 


Section-by-Section Analysis 
 
This proposal would implement a recommendation in the President’s Budget to establish 


a pilot program that would increase participation of new innovative entities in federal contracting 
through the use of innovation set-asides.  An innovation set-aside would allow an agency to limit 
competition, or make an award without competition, to firms that lack experience selling to the 
government but who can deliver innovation needed by federal customers, such as new 
technologies or ways of solving problems.  


 
A key goal of a strong acquisition system is the ability to drive innovation and 


productivity in the delivery of service to the taxpayer.  While many existing federal contractors – 
small and large – provide innovative solutions to meet the government’s needs, agencies can face 
significant challenges gaining access to innovation when it is not available under existing 
contracts or from existing federal contractors.  Much of the nation’s innovation is developed by 
companies who are quite small and for whom government contracting is an enigma.  
Unfortunately, current statutory competition requirements make it difficult for agencies to reach 
these companies without making them compete against experienced government contractors who 
are much more skilled on how to win a competition for a federal agency requirement.  


 
This proposal would authorize a modest pilot to allow Defense and civilian agencies to 


test – for a small number of acquisitions – a process where consideration is limited to one or 
more start-up companies and companies that are established but have not done business with the 
government but who can provide a needed innovation.  The proposal anticipates that awards 
would generally be made to small businesses.  However, in recognition of the fact that solutions 
may be offered by a large entity that has not previously done business with the government, the 
proposal would authorize awards to entities of any size after giving special consideration to a 
small business concern.  Innovation set-asides would supplement, not replace, the important 
tools that currently exist as pathways into the federal marketplace – including subcontracting, the 
Small Business Innovation Research program, the Small Business Administration’s 8(a) business 
development program for small-disadvantaged businesses, and the mentor-protégé program 
where small business protégés serve as prime contractors that are mentored by experienced large 
businesses.  Nor would the pilot substitute for incentives, such as value engineering, that may be 
used to encourage incumbent federal contractors to work with their agencies to identify 
innovative measures to reduce costs and increase quality.  Instead, the innovation set-aside 
would provide an alternative when those tools don’t easily allow agencies to reach new entrants 
offering the types of solutions needed to meet their requirements.   


 
Budgetary Implications:  There would be no budgetary impact as a result of these legislative 
changes because the proposal is only an authorization and would not increase the overall budget 
requirements of the Department or any other federal agency. 
 
Changes to Existing Law:  This proposal would not change the text of existing law 








   


1 
 


 


SEC. 841. MICRO-PURCHASE THRESHOLD APPLICABLE TO GOVERNMENT 1 


PROCUREMENTS.   2 


 (a) INCREASE IN THRESHOLD.—Section 1902 of title 41, United States Code, is 3 


amended— 4 


 (1) in subsection (a), by striking “$3,000” and inserting “$10,000”; and 5 


 (2) in subsections (d) and (e), by striking “not greater than $3,000” and inserting 6 


“with a price not greater than the micro-purchase threshold”. 7 


(b) OMB GUIDANCE.—The Director of the Office of Management and Budget shall 8 


update the guidance in Circular A-123, Appendix B, as appropriate, to ensure that agencies— 9 


(1) follow sound acquisition practices when making purchases using the 10 


Government purchase card; and 11 


(2) maintain internal controls that reduce the risk of fraud, waste, and abuse in 12 


Government charge card programs.   13 


(c) CONVENIENCE CHECKS.—A convenience check may not be used for an amount in 14 


excess of one half of the micro-purchase threshold under section 1902(a) of title 41, United 15 


States Code, or a lower amount set by the head of the agency, and use of convenience checks 16 


shall comply with controls prescribed in OMB Circular A-123, Appendix B. 17 


[PLEASE NOTE: THE “CHANGES TO EXISTING LAW” SECTION BELOW SETS OUT IN RED-
LINE FORMAT HOW THE LEGISLATIVE TEXT ABOVE WOULD AMEND EXISTING LAW.] 
 


Section-by-Section Analysis 
 


This proposal would increase the micro-purchase threshold (MPT) in Government 
procurements from $3,000 to $10,000 so that federal agencies would have the option to authorize 
personnel, as appropriate, to have higher limits on their Government purchase card, referred to 
hereafter as “purchase card,” to facilitate easy and administratively efficient purchasing of small 
dollar items.  This increase would affect less than one percent of federal contract spending, but 
could allow hundreds of thousands of transactions to be conducted more efficiently.  This 
proposal would not make changes to the thresholds in the Davis-Bacon Act or the Service 







   


2 
 


 


Contract Act.  Nor would it change the threshold levels that are authorized during contingency 
operations or certain other types of emergencies.      


 
Purchase cards give agency end users an efficient tool to make simple purchases 


themselves and, at the same time, offer a number of additional benefits for both the agency and 
its vendors.  In the two decades since the MPT was established, purchase cards have reduced 
transaction costs for government payment offices by lowering the number of 
budgetary/accounting entries that need to be processed in financial management systems, 
allowed agencies to earn rebates, and helped vendors receive timely payment without the burden 
of having to process government invoices.  Equally important, by putting purchase cards into the 
hands of properly trained end users to make purchase directly, the burden of making micro-
purchases has largely been lifted from the shoulders of contracting officers, allowing them to 
instead give greater attention to larger, more complex procurements, where their acquisition 
training and expertise can be put to better use and have greater impact.  


 
In 2010, the MPT was adjusted for inflation from $2,500 to $3,000 and would be adjusted 


again this year to $3,500, pursuant to authority provided in 41 U.S.C. 1908.  While these 
adjustments will help agencies to leverage the efficiencies of the purchase card for additional 
small dollar transactions, there are many needs between $3,000 and $10,000 that can be more 
efficiently acquired with a purchase card in the hands of a trained end user.  Some of these 
routine needs did not exist in the 1990s and therefore were not envisioned when the MPT level 
was first established, such as those for digital services, including web applications, application 
program interfaces, simple cloud services, scalable web hosting services, case management, 
platforms to support on-line interactive dialogues, IT systems monitoring, and tools to measure 
and improve digital customer experiences  -- all of which can be purchased easily by program 
and IT technical experts through existing government-wide and multi-agency contracts that 
include pre-negotiated terms and conditions which are well suited for small dollar purchases.   


 
The benefits of purchase cards cannot be realized unless coupled with smart buying 


practices, such as those that encourage purchases through existing vehicles where they can meet 
agency needs.  For this reason, this proposal would require OMB to update Appendix B of 
Circular A-123, Improving the Management of Government Charge Card Programs, (herein 
after referred to as Appendix B) as appropriate, to reflect principles of category management that 
encourage placement of orders against best in class vehicles and best practices for maximizing 
opportunities for small businesses, as identified by OMB in its 2011 guidance implementing 
section 1322 of the Small Business Jobs Act.   


 
Purchase card activity must also be conducted in accordance with strong financial 


management controls that help agencies detect and prevent fraud, waste and abuse.  Accordingly, 
the proposal would further require OMB to update Appendix B to reinforce and strengthen 
existing controls applicable to current government purchase card transactions, appropriately 
increase the oversight responsibilities of agency management and agency Inspectors General on 
expenditures in accordance with the Government Charge Card Abuse Prevention Act of 2012, 
P.L. 112-94, and reporting required by OMB Memorandum M-13-21, which implements the Act, 
and align these controls  with the threshold for mandatory reporting for certain financial 
transactions.   







   


3 
 


 


 
Appendix B would also establish appropriate limits on the use of convenience checks, not 


to exceed one half of the micro-purchase threshold.  Convenience checks are generally only 
authorized when a merchant does not accept a purchase card. Appendix B currently includes a 
chapter on internal controls for convenience checks (Chapter 12). Specifically, convenience 
checks may be written only to vendors who do not accept the purchase card, for emergency 
incident response, and for other Agency approved purposes that comply with Public Law 104-
134, the Debt Collection Improvement Act of 1996. Controls on the use of convenience checks 
will be updated not to exceed one half of the micro-purchase threshold, and limits on the use of 
convenience checks will be identified in Appendix B. 


  
In the past 10 years, Federal agencies have deployed a number of systems and internal 


controls to reduce the risk of fraud, waste, abuse, and misuse associated with the purchase card.  
Examples of agency actions include implementation of government-wide metrics for 
Government charge cards programs under the General Services Administration (GSA) SmartPay 
program to improve security including purchase card transactions.  As part of Federal efforts, 
GSA SmartPay has made available data analytics and data mining tools provided by servicing 
banks and brands.  The metrics identify potential areas of misuse or fraud for further 
investigation in categories of disputed charges; single merchant spending; use of data analytics 
tools; as well as a targeted group of questionable transactions.  


 
Also for the Department of Defense (DoD), the Director of Defense Procurement and 


Acquisition Policy (DPAP) maintains a robust website on the purchase card at 
http://www.acq.osd.mil/dpap/pdi/pc/index.html.  The website includes current Policy Documents 
and Guides including the DoD Government Charge Card Guidebook for Establishing and 
Managing Purchase, Travel, and Fuel Card Programs, dated May 30, 2014.  The Guidebook’s 
purpose is to help DoD officials establish and manage charge card programs.  As required by 
Appendix B, DPAP published the Purchase Card Management Plan (2014), which also outlines 
policies and procedures used by DoD to ensure that the objectives of the DoD’s purchase card 
program are realized and that an effective system of internal controls is in place to mitigate the 
potential for fraud, misuse, and abuse.  The DoD’s purchase card policies and procedures comply 
with the conforming amendments to subsection (b) of section 2784 of title 10, United States 
Code, as amended by the Government Charge Card Abuse Prevention Act.  Additionally, DoD 
policy requires all cardholders, approving officials, and certifying officials to complete basic 
purchase card training prior to assuming their official purchase card program roles and 
responsibilities.  Purchase card refresher training is required every two years thereafter.  These 
courses are provided through Defense Acquisition University courses (CLG 001 and CLG 004).   


 
Additionally, DoD has implemented automated oversight systems to provide managers 


visibility of internal control effectiveness in mitigating the risk of improper purchases.  Purchase 
card participants are using DoD-wide systems to improve the accountability of their purchase 
card programs, such as the automated systems (e.g. Purchase Card Online System (PCOLS)) to 
audit 100 percent of all DoD purchase card transactions.  Through a set of risk predictive 
business rules, PCOLS or a similar Navy capability, scores each transaction against data points 
such as the merchant category code, cardholder spend limits, frequency of purchase card usage, 
and where the transaction was made.  On a monthly basis, these systems flag over 3 percent of 







   


4 
 


 


transactions that score in the highest risk categories, and alert the installation program 
coordinator to conduct an independent review.  The system also randomly flags about 1 percent 
of all other transactions for review by the cardholder’s immediate supervisor, or someone in his 
or her chain of command.  Each identified transaction is reviewed and addressed by the proper 
authorities (e.g., the cardholder’s commander, base legal office, etc.).  If it is determined that due 
diligence was not exercised by a cardholder, a variety of remedies and punitive actions exist.  
These include mandatory remedial training, card suspension, and other disciplinary actions under 
applicable directives, regulations, Federal Law, and the Uniform Code of Military Justice or 
civilian disciplinary actions.  In addition, these systems are used to support quarterly and semi-
annual statistical and violation reports to OSD, which in turn submits the report to the OMB and 
the GSA for analysis and policy recommendations.   


 
Updates to Appendix B will be informed by the agency experiences and risk assessments 


described above along with reports and audits from agencies and Inspectors General and other 
applicable reviews.  The Appendix will continue to hold agencies responsible for ensuring 
authorizations for card holders are appropriate for that individual’s responsibilities and activities.  
As a result, if this proposal is enacted, individual purchase card limits would not be raised 
automatically.  Instead, agencies would review existing limits and make adjustments based on 
organizational need and the responsibilities of the end user.  For instance, an agency may leave 
unchanged an office manager’s current authorization level of $1,000 to make purchase card 
transactions for office supplies from the OS3 contract established under the Federal Strategic 
Sourcing Initiative if this limit remains sufficient in light of the organization’s needs for office 
supplies.  By contrast, the agency may raise the purchase card limits for technical personnel in 
the agency’s digital strategy office for the reasons stated above, so that these users can make 
purchases directly, rather than burdening their contracting officer for a rapid decision and 
clearance to place an order.  In situations where contracting officers continue making purchases 
for the agency under $10,000, they will still benefit by being able to take advantage of the 
efficiencies offered by the purchase card in conducting these transactions.   


 
Finally, GSA will continue to ensure there is appropriate transparency of purchase card 


activity on USASpending.gov so information on use of the purchase card below the micro-
purchase threshold is available to the public, consistent with agency security requirements.   
  
Budgetary Implications:  There would be no budgetary impact f o r  t h e  D e p a r t m e n t  o f  
D e f e n s e  o r  c i v i l i a n  a ge n c i e s  as a result of this legislative change because the proposal 
only addresses the micro-purchase dollar threshold and would not increase the overall budget 
requirements of the Department of Defense or other agencies.     
 
Changes to Existing Law:  This proposal would amend title 41, United States Code, as 
follows: 
 


TITLE 41, UNITED STATES CODE 
 


§ 1902. Procedures applicable to purchases below micro-purchase threshold 
 







   


5 
 


 


 (a) DEFINITION.—For purposes of this section, the micro-purchase threshold 
is $3,000 $10,000. 
 
 (b) COMPLIANCE WITH CERTAIN REQUIREMENTS AND NONAPPLICABILITY OF CERTAIN 
AUTHORITY.— 


 (1) COMPLIANCE WITH CERTAIN REQUIREMENTS.—The head of each executive 
agency shall ensure that procuring activities of that agency, when awarding a contract 
with a price exceeding the micro-purchase threshold, comply with the requirements of 
section 8(a) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 637(a)), section 2323 of title 10, and 
section 7102 of the Federal Acquisition Streamlining Act of 1994 (Public Law 103–
355, 15 U.S.C. 644 note). 
 (2) NONAPPLICABILITY OF CERTAIN AUTHORITY.—The authority under part 
13.106(a)(1) of the Federal Acquisition Regulation (48 C.F.R. 13.106(a)(1)), as in 
effect on November 18, 1993, to make purchases without securing competitive 
quotations does not apply to a purchase with a price exceeding the micro-purchase 
threshold. 


 
 (c) NONAPPLICABILITY OF CERTAIN PROVISIONS.—An executive agency purchase with 
an anticipated value of the micro-purchase threshold or less is not subject to section 15(j) of 
the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 644(j)) and chapter 83 of this title. 
 
 (d) PURCHASES WITHOUT COMPETITIVE QUOTATIONS.—A purchase with a price not 
greater than $3,000 the micro-purchase threshold may be made without obtaining 
competitive quotations if an employee of an executive agency or a member of the armed 
forces, authorized to do so, determines that the price for the purchase is reasonable. 
 
 (e) EQUITABLE DISTRIBUTION.—Purchases with a price not greater than $3,000 the 
micro-purchase threshold shall be distributed equitably among qualified suppliers. 
 
 (f) IMPLEMENTATION THROUGH FEDERAL ACQUISITION REGULATion.—This section 
shall be implemented through the Federal Acquisition Regulation. 
 








   


1 


SEC. 304. ESTABLISHMENT OF SOUTHERN SEA OTTER MILITARY READINESS 1 


AREAS. 2 


(a) ESTABLISHMENT OF THE SOUTHERN SEA OTTER MILITARY READINESS AREAS.—3 


Chapter 631 of title 10, United States Code, is amended by adding at the end the following new 4 


section: 5 


“§ 7235. Southern Sea Otter Military Readiness Areas 6 


“(a) ESTABLISHMENT.—The Secretary of the Navy shall establish areas, to be known as 7 


‘Southern Sea Otter Military Readiness Areas’, for national defense purposes. Such areas shall 8 


include each of the following: 9 


“(1) The area that includes Naval Base Ventura County, San Nicolas Island, and 10 


Begg Rock and the adjacent and surrounding waters within the following coordinates: 11 


“N. Latitude/W. Longitude 12 


“33°27.8´/119°34.3´  13 


“33°20.5´/119°15.5´  14 


“33°13.5´/119°11.8´  15 


“33°06.5´/119°15.3´  16 


“33°02.8´/119°26.8´  17 


“33°08.8´/119°46.3´  18 


“33°17.2´/119°56.9´  19 


“33°30.9´/119°54.2´. 20 


“(2) The area that includes Naval Base Coronado, San Clemente Island and the 21 


adjacent and surrounding waters running parallel to shore to 3 nautical miles from the 22 







   


2 


high tide line designated by part 165 of title 33, Code of Federal Regulations, on May 20, 1 


2010, as the San Clemente Island 3NM Safety Zone.  2 


“(b) ACTIVITIES WITHIN THE SOUTHERN SEA OTTER MILITARY READINESS AREAS.— 3 


“(1) INCIDENTAL TAKINGS UNDER ENDANGERED SPECIES ACT OF 1973.—Sections 4 4 


and 9 of the Endangered Species Act of 1973 (16 U.S.C. 1533, 1538) shall not apply with 5 


respect to the incidental taking of any southern sea otter in the Southern Sea Otter 6 


Military Readiness Areas in the course of conducting a military readiness activity. 7 


“(2) INCIDENTAL TAKINGS UNDER MARINE MAMMAL PROTECTION ACT OF 1972.—8 


Sections 101 and 102 of the Marine Mammal Protection Act of 1972 (16 U.S.C. 1371, 9 


1372) shall not apply with respect to the incidental taking of any southern sea otter in the 10 


Southern Sea Otter Military Readiness Areas in the course of conducting a military 11 


readiness activity. 12 


“(3) TREATMENT AS SPECIES PROPOSED TO BE LISTED.—For purposes of 13 


conducting a military readiness activity, any southern sea otter while within the Southern 14 


Sea Otter Military Readiness Areas shall be treated for the purposes of section 7 of the 15 


Endangered Species Act of 1973 (16 U.S.C. 1536) as a member of a species that is 16 


proposed to be listed as an endangered species or a threatened species under section 4 of 17 


the Endangered Species Act of 1973 (16 U.S.C. 1533). 18 


“(c) REMOVAL.—Nothing in this section or any other Federal law shall be construed to 19 


require that any southern sea otter located within the Southern Sea Otter Military Readiness 20 


Areas be removed from the Areas. 21 


“(d) REVISION OR TERMINATION OF EXCEPTIONS.—The Secretary of the Interior may 22 


revise or terminate the application of subsection (b) if the Secretary of the Interior, in 23 







   


3 


consultation with the Secretary of the Navy, determines that military activities occurring in the 1 


Southern Sea Otter Military Readiness Areas are impeding the southern sea otter conservation or 2 


the return of southern sea otters to optimum sustainable population levels. 3 


“(e) MONITORING.— 4 


“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of the Navy shall conduct monitoring and 5 


research within the Southern Sea Otter Military Readiness Areas to determine the effects 6 


of military readiness activities on the growth or decline of the southern sea otter 7 


population and on the near-shore ecosystem. Monitoring and research parameters and 8 


methods shall be determined in consultation with the United States Fish and Wildlife 9 


Service. 10 


“(2) TRIENNIAL REPORT.—Not later than 24 months after the date of the 11 


enactment of this section and every three years thereafter, the Secretary of the Navy shall 12 


submit to Congress and the public a report on monitoring undertaken pursuant to 13 


paragraph (1). 14 


 “(g) DEFINITIONS.—In this section: 15 


“(1) SOUTHERN SEA OTTER.—The term ‘southern sea otter’ means any member of 16 


the subspecies Enhydra lutris nereis. 17 


“(2) TAKE.—The term ‘take’— 18 


“(A) when used in reference to activities subject to regulation by the 19 


Endangered Species Act of 1973 (16 U.S.C. 1531 et seq.), shall have the meaning 20 


given such term in that Act; and 21 







   


4 


“(B) when used in reference to activities subject to regulation by the 1 


Marine Mammal Protection Act of 1972 (16 U.S.C. 1361 et seq.) shall have the 2 


meaning given such term in that Act. 3 


“(3) INCIDENTAL TAKING.—The term ‘incidental taking’ means any take of a 4 


southern sea otter that is incidental to, and not the purpose of, the carrying out of an 5 


otherwise lawful activity. 6 


“(4) MILITARY READINESS ACTIVITY.—The term ‘military readiness activity’ has 7 


the meaning given that term in section 315(f) of the Bob Stump National Defense 8 


Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2003 (16 U.S.C. 703 note) and includes all training and 9 


operations of the armed forces that relate to combat and the adequate and realistic testing 10 


of military equipment, vehicles, weapons, and sensors for proper operation and suitability 11 


for combat use. 12 


“(5) OPTIMUM SUSTAINABLE POPULATION.—The term ‘optimum sustainable 13 


population’ means, with respect to any population stock, the number of animals that will 14 


result in the maximum productivity of the population or the species, keeping in mind the 15 


carrying capacity of the habitat and the health of the ecosystem of which they form a 16 


constituent element.”. 17 


(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of sections at the beginning of such chapter is 18 


amended by adding at the end the following new item: 19 


“7235. Southern Sea Otter Military Readiness Areas.”. 


(c) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 1 of Public Law 99-625 (16 U.S.C. 1536 note) 20 


is repealed. 21 


 
Section-by-Section Analysis 


 







   


5 


This proposal would allow the U.S. Fish & Wildlife Service (USFWS) and the 
Department of the Navy to provide for the conservation needs of the Southern Sea Otter while 
continuing the protections for military readiness activities at important offshore islands in the 
Southern California Bight that were provided by Public Law (P.L.) 99-625 while the 
translocation program was in effect.    


 
In the 1980’s, threats to the Southern Sea Otter included its small population size, its 


greatly reduced range, and the potential risk of oil spills.  In response, the USFWS developed a 
plan to establish an independent colony of otters sufficiently removed from the parent population 
to serve as a safeguard for the population as a whole in the event of a natural or manmade 
catastrophe.  Following an Environmental Impact Statement that identified San Nicolas Island as 
a potential host site for a separate population, Navy supported P.L. 99-625, which authorized the 
plan along with protection for military activities throughout the management zone and San 
Nicholas Island, as well as protection for defense-related agency activities under the Endangered 
Species Act (ESA), but no similar exemption under the Marine Mammal Protection Act 
(MMPA) at San Nicolas Island.  Similarly, Navy supported the USFWS governing regulations, 
which effectively protected military uses at San Nicolas and were published on August 11, 1987 
(52 FR 29754).  Between August 1987 and March 1990 the USFWS and the California 
Department of Fish & Game administered the plan, with cooperation from and in reliance on 
support from the U.S. Navy, and established an experimental colony of Southern Sea Otters in a 
translocation zone around San Nicolas Island. The island is a military installation attached to 
Naval Base Ventura County and a major asset for Navy Test, Evaluation, Training and 
Experimentation operations.  Once the plan was implemented, provisions of P.L. 99-625 became 
operative and provided for protection of defense-related agency activities from the consultation 
requirements of the ESA, with respect to southern sea otters, within the translocation zone and 
both the ESA and MMPA within a management zone throughout the Southern California Bight.  
The management zone encompassed the U.S. Navy’s Point Mugu Sea Range (that includes San 
Nicolas Island), the U.S. Navy’s Southern California Offshore Range (that includes San 
Clemente Island), and coastal military installations. 


 
Implementation of the plan resulted in the presence of a healthy but small population of 


Southern Sea Otters at the translocation site, but due to the high initial rate of emigration of 
translocated sea otters and unforeseen problems with capturing and relocating sea otters, failed to 
meet the original objectives of the USFWS.  Following the Exxon Valdez oil spill, the USFWS 
also determined that Southern Sea Otters at San Nicolas Island would not be isolated from the 
effects of a single large oil spill as originally envisioned.  Moreover, large numbers of sea otters 
were moving southward down the California coast into the management zone, and experience 
with plan implementation indicated that further removal of otters from the management zone 
could result in substantial adverse effects on the parent population.  Consequently the USFWS 
ultimately terminated the program with the release of a Final Rule and Record of Decision on 
December 19, 2012. 


 
The termination of the translocation program and its associated translocation and 


management zones renders the specific provisions of P.L. 99-625 inoperative.  As such, the 
USFWS has stated that exemptions for defense-related agency activities found in P.L. 99-625 no 
longer apply.  Whereas USFWS believes that programmatic consultations afford a feasible 







   


6 


means of minimizing the regulatory burden on Navy associated with ESA compliance for sea 
otters, Navy believes that the loss of the protective provisions for military activities in P.L. 99-
625 poses national security concerns.      
 
 The USFWS has publicly stated that current military readiness activities at San Nicolas 
Island pose no threat to the conservation and recovery of Southern Sea Otters.  In relation to 
Navy activities, the USFWS Supplemental Environmental Impact Statement states, “[t]o date, we 
have no evidence that defense-related activities have had any adverse effects on sea otters at San 
Nicolas Island or in the management zone,” which included San Clemente Island (where sea 
otters do not currently occur) as well as other areas of Naval activity throughout the Southern 
California Bight.  Navy’s Sikes Act Integrated Natural Resources Management Plans (INRMPs) 
for military installations in California also address special management needs of threatened and 
endangered species and provide conservation benefits to near shore marine environments 
through watershed and land-based management actions.  It is clear that Navy has been an 
exemplary custodian of the translocated otters; however, with the return to full ESA 
applicability, mitigation requirements could ultimately limit types and quantity of military 
readiness activities in these critically important testing and training areas.  
 


This proposal would continue the protections afforded by the military activity provisions 
originally enacted in P.L. 99-625, but on a generally smaller scale (the MMPA exemption with 
respect to sea otters around San Nicolas Island was not included in P.L. 99-625 and thus 
increases protections for military readiness activities there).  The management zone originally 
prescribed by P.L. 99-625 encompassed the entirety of the Southern California Bight.  This 
legislation identifies two comparatively small marine areas adjacent to important land-based 
military test and training areas where the military activity provisions will apply.  This proposal 
includes both monitoring and reporting requirements for the Department of the Navy not enacted 
as part of P.L. 99-625, and a termination provision. 
 
Budgetary Implications:  This proposal is not expected to result in changes to the existing 
budget, as military installations already develop and incorporate actions that protect and 
conserve the Southern Sea Otter currently at San Nicolas Island.  No Operation & Maintenance, 
Navy, funds are budgeted separately to protect and conserve the Southern Sea Otter population at 
San Nicolas Island.  The monitoring of the otter population is carried out by the U.S. Geological 
Survey agency.  This proposal is not expected to generate fiscal savings but will help eliminate 
the potential for possibly expensive constraints on military readiness activities. 
 


RESOURCE REQUIREMENTS ($MILLIONS) 


 FY 
2016 


FY 
2017 


FY 
2018 


FY 
2019 


FY 
2020 


Appropriation 
To 


Budget 
Activity 


Dash-1 
Line 
Item 


Program 
Element 


 0 0 0 0 0     
 
Changes to Existing Law:  This proposal would add a new section to title 10, United States 
Code, shown in full in the legislative text above, and would repeal section 1 of Public Law 99-
625 (16 U.S.C. 1536 note), as follows: 
 







   


7 


SECTION 1. TRANSLOCATION OF CALIFORNIA SEA OTTERS. 
 


(a) DEFINITIONS.—For purposes of this section- 
(1) The term ‘Act’ means the Endangered Species Act of 1973 (16 U.S.C. 1531 et 


seq.). 
(2) The term ‘agency action’ has the meaning given that term in section 7(a)(2) of 


the Act. 
(3) The term ‘experimental population’ means the population of sea otters 


provided for under a plan developed under subsection (b). 
(4) The phrase ‘parent population’ means the population of sea otters existing in 


California on the date on which proposed regulations setting forth a proposed plan under 
subsection (b) are issued. 


(5) The phrase ‘prospective action’ refers to any prospective agency action that- 
(A) may affect either the experimental population or the parent population; 


and 
(B) has evolved to the point where meaningful consultation under section 


7(a)(2) or (3) of the Act can take place. 
(6) The term ‘Secretary’ means the Secretary of the Interior. 
(7) The term ‘Service’ means the United States Fish and Wildlife Service. 


 
(b) PLAN SPECIFICATIONS.—The Secretary may develop and implement, in accordance 


with this section, a plan for the relocation and management of a population of California sea 
otters from the existing range of the parent population to another location. The plan, which must 
be developed by regulation and administered by the Service in cooperation with the appropriate 
State agency, shall include the following: 


(1) The number, age, and sex of sea otters proposed to be relocated. 
(2) The manner in which the sea otters will be captured, translocated, released, 


monitored, and protected. 
(3) The specification of a zone (hereinafter referred to as the ‘translocation zone’) 


to which the experimental population will be relocated. The zone must have appropriate 
characteristics for furthering the conservation of the species. 


(4) The specification of a zone (hereinafter referred to as the ‘management zone’) 
that— 


(A) surrounds the translocation zone; and 
(B) does not include the existing range of the parent population or adjacent 


range where expansion is necessary for the recovery of the species. 
The purpose of the management zone is to (i) facilitate the management of sea otters and the 
containment of the experimental population within the translocation zone, and (ii) to prevent, to 
the maximum extent feasible, conflict with other fishery resources within the management zone 
by the experimental population. Any sea otter found within the management zone shall be treated 
as a member of the experimental population. The Service shall use all feasible non-lethal means 
and measures to capture any sea otter found within the management zone and return it to either 
the translocation zone or to the range of the parent population. 


(5) Measures, including an adequate funding mechanism, to isolate and contain 
the experimental population. 







   


8 


(6) A description of the relationship of the implementation of the plan to the status 
of the species under the Act and to determinations of the Secretary under section 7 of the 
Act. 
(c) STATUS OF MEMBERS OF THE EXPERIMENTAL POPULATION.—(1) Any member of the 


experimental population shall be treated while within the translocation zone as a threatened 
species for purposes of the Act, except that— 


(A) section 7 of the Act shall only apply to agency actions that- 
(i) are undertaken within the translocation zone, 
(ii) are not defense-related agency actions, and 
(iii) are initiated after the date of the enactment of this section [Nov. 7, 1986]; and 


(B) with respect to defense-related actions within the translocation zone, members of the 
experimental population shall be treated as members of a species that is proposed to be listed 
under section 4 of the Act. 
For purposes of this paragraph, the term ‘defense-related agency action’ means an agency action 
proposed to be carried out directly by a military department. 


(2) For purposes of section 7 of the Act, any member of the experimental population shall 
be treated while within the management zone as a member of a species that is proposed to be 
listed under section 4 of the Act. Section 9 of the Act [16 U.S.C. 1538] applies to members of the 
experimental population; except that any incidental taking of such a member during the course of 
an otherwise lawful activity within the management zone, may not be treated as a violation of the 
Act or the Marine Mammal Protection Act of 1972. 


 
(d) IMPLEMENTATION OF PLAN.-The Secretary shall implement the plan developed under 


subsection (b)— 
(1) after the Secretary provides an opinion under section 7(b) of the Act regarding 


each prospective action for which consultation was initiated by a Federal agency or 
requested by a prospective permit or license applicant before April 1, 1986; or 


(2) if no consultation under section 7(a)(2) or (3) regarding any prospective action 
is initiated or requested by April 1, 1986, at any time after that date. 
 
(e) CONSULTATION AND EFFECT OF OPINION.—A Federal agency shall promptly consult 


with the Secretary, under section 7(a)(3) of the Act , at the request of, and in cooperation with, 
any permit or license applicant regarding any prospective action. The time limitations applicable 
to consultations under section 7(a)(2) of the Act apply to consultations under the preceding 
sentence. In applying section 7(b)(3)(B) with respect to an opinion on a prospective action that is 
provided after consultation under section 7(a)(3), that opinion shall be treated as the opinion 
issued after consultation under section 7(a)(2) unless the Secretary finds, after notice and 
opportunity for comment in accordance with section 553 of title 5, United States Code, that a 
significant change has been made with respect to the action or that a significant change has 
occurred regarding the information used during the initial consultation. The interested party may 
petition the Secretary to make a finding under the preceding sentence. The Secretary may 
implement any reasonable and prudent alternatives specified in any opinion referred to in this 
subsection through appropriate agreements with any such Federal agency, prospective permit or 
license applicant, or other interested party. 
 







   


9 


(f) CONSTRUCTION.—For purposes of implementing the plan, no act by the Service, an 
authorized State agency, or an authorized agent of the Service or such an agency with respect to 
a sea otter that is necessary to effect the relocation or management of any sea otter under the plan 
may be treated as a violation of any provision of the Act or the Marine Mammal Protection Act 
of 1972 (16 U.S.C. 1361 et seq.). 
 


 





		“§ 7235. Southern Sea Otter Military Readiness Areas






1 


SEC. 842.  INCREASE IN SIMPLIFIED ACQUISITION THRESHOLD AND IN SMALL 1 


BUSINESS SET-ASIDE THRESHOLD. 2 


(a) SIMPLIFIED ACQUISITION THRESHOLD.— 3 


(1) GENERAL THRESHOLD.—Section 134 of title 41, United States Code, is 4 


amended by striking “$100,000” and inserting “$500,000”. 5 


 (2) SPECIAL EMERGENCY PROCUREMENT AUTHORITY DOMESTIC THRESHOLD.—6 


Section 1903(b)(2) of such title is amended by striking “means—” and all that follows in 7 


that section and inserting “means $1,000,000; and”. 8 


(b) SMALL BUSINESS ACT SET-ASIDE THRESHOLD.—Section 15(j) of the Small Business 9 


Act (15 U.S.C. 644(j)), is amended— 10 


 (1) in paragraph (1), by striking “$100,000” and inserting “$500,000”; and 11 


 (2) in paragraph (3), by striking “$100,000” and inserting “$500,000”.12 


Section-by-Section Analysis 
 
This proposal would increase two thresholds applicable to Federal procurement: the 


simplified acquisition threshold (SAT) under title 41, United States Code, and the small business 
set-aside threshold under the Small Business Act. 


 
Additionally this proposal would increase the simplified acquisition threshold under  


title 41, United States Code, 1903, for contracts or purchases made in the United States in 
support of contingency operations to $1,000,000.  Without the increase, contracts or purchases 
made in the United States in support of contingency operations would be limited by the FAR 
2.101 to $300,000 and would negatively impact the U.S. government ability to support the 
warfighter in a contingency environment.   


 
In 1994, Congress created the simplified acquisition threshold (SAT) to enable agencies 


to acquire small dollar acquisitions below the threshold with minimum transaction costs and 
Government-unique burdens.  This proposal would implement a recommendation made in the 
President’s Budget to increase the SAT from its present value of $150,000 to $500,000.  This 
increase would recognize that transactions in this dollar range typically bear the characteristics of 
small dollar transactions and should therefore be treated as SAT purchases rather than being 
subject to government-unique compliance requirements that are applied to multi-million dollar 
acquisitions.  The proposal would also amend the Small Business Act to raise the statutory 







2 


threshold for small business set-asides to the same $500,000 level given the significant amount 
of work that can be performed by small businesses in this dollar range.    


 
SAT purchases subject contractors to fewer compliance requirements, including those 


calling for formal programs, certifications, reporting, and oversight.  In addition, SAT purchases 
allow agencies to transact with interested sources using simplified acquisition procedures, which 
generally entail shorter solicitations, greater reliance on a contractor’s existing product literature, 
simpler evaluation processes and less detailed documentation.  As a result of this relief, contract 
actions under the SAT often bear a greater similarity to generally accepted commercial practices 
when compared to larger procurements, which makes it easier and less costly for agencies and 
contractors to do business.     


 
When the SAT was first created, Congress established the threshold at $100,000.  In 


2010, the Federal Acquisition Regulatory Council (FAR Council) raised the threshold to 
$150,000 to reflect inflation, pursuant to authority provided by 41 U.S.C. 1908.  While this 
adjustment has been beneficial, it leaves acquisitions between $150,000 and $500,000 subject to 
the same compliance requirements as a contract for millions of dollars or more even though these 
modestly sized acquisitions typically share many of the same characteristics as small dollar 
acquisitions – namely, the agency has requirements that can be satisfied with commercial 
products and services.  This proposal would raise the threshold to $500,000 so that Defense and 
civilian agencies could apply a simplified and faster procurement approach to approximately 
15,000 procurement transactions than is possible under the existing threshold of $150,000.  This 
increase involves only about 1 percent of Federal contracting dollars (about $4.5 billion in fiscal 
year (FY) 2013), thus leaving the majority of government spending under the compliance 
controls intended for large contracts. 


 
Agencies are currently required to set aside purchases under $150,000 for small business 


participation.  Work under this amount is made available to other businesses only when there are 
not two or more responsible small businesses capable of performing the required work at fair and 
reasonable prices.  This proposal would amend the Small Business Act to raise the statutory set-
aside requirement to $500,000 in light of the significant amount of work that currently is 
performed by small businesses between $150,000 and $500,000 (57 percent in FY 2013) so that 
these entities may benefit from the simplification made possible by the SAT. 


 
Budgetary Implications:  There would be no budgetary impact as a result of these legislative 
changes because the proposal is only an authorization and would not increase the overall budget 
requirements of the Department or any other Federal agency.   
 
Changes to Existing Law:  This proposal would amend title 41, United States Code, and the 
Small Business Act as follows: 
 


TITLE 41, UNITED STATES CODE 
 
§ 134. Simplified acquisition threshold 
 
 In division B, the term “simplified acquisition threshold” means $100,000 $500,000.  







3 


 
******* 


   § 1903. Special emergency procurement authority 
 


(a) APPLICABILITY.—The authorities provided in subsections (b) and (c) apply with 
respect to a procurement of property or services by or for an executive agency that the head of 
the executive agency determines are to be used— 


(1) in support of a contingency operation (as defined in section 101(a) of title 10); 
or 


(2) to facilitate the defense against or recovery from nuclear, biological, chemical, 
or radiological attack against the United States. 
 
(b) INCREASED THRESHOLDS AND LIMITATION.—For a procurement to which this section 


applies under subsection (a)— 
(1) the amount specified in section 1902(a), (d), and (e) of this title shall be 


deemed to be— 
(A) $15,000 in the case of a contract to be awarded and performed, or 


purchase to be made, in the United States; and 
(B) $25,000 in the case of a contract to be awarded and performed, or 


purchase to be made, outside the United States; 
(2) the term "simplified acquisition threshold" means— 


(A) $250,000 in the case of a contract to be awarded and performed, or 
purchase to be made, in the United States; and 


(B) $1,000,000 in the case of a contract to be awarded and performed, or 
purchase to be made, outside the United States; and 
(3) the $5,000,000 limitation in sections 1901(a)(2) and 3305(a)(2) of this title 


and section 2304(g)(1)(B) of title 10 is deemed to be $10,000,000. 
 
(c) AUTHORITY TO TREAT PROPERTY OR SERVICE AS COMMERCIAL ITEM.—  


(1) IN GENERAL.—The head of an executive agency carrying out a procurement of 
property or a service to which this section applies under subsection (a)(2) may treat the 
property or service as a commercial item for the purpose of carrying out the procurement. 


(2) CERTAIN CONTRACTS NOT EXEMPT FROM STANDARDS OR REQUIREMENTS.—A 
contract in an amount of more than $15,000,000 that is awarded on a sole source basis for 
an item or service treated as a commercial item under paragraph (1) is not exempt from— 


(A) cost accounting standards prescribed under section 1502 of this title; 
or 


(B) cost or pricing data requirements (commonly referred to as truth in 
negotiating) under chapter 35 of this title and section 2306a of title 10. 


 
_______ 
 


SMALL BUSINESS ACT 
 


 SEC.15. (a) *** 
 







4 


******* 
 
 (j)(1) Each contract for the purchase of goods and services that has an anticipated value 
greater than $2,500 but not greater than $100,000 $500,000 shall be reserved exclusively for 
small business concerns unless the contracting officer is unable to obtain offers from two or 
more small business concerns that are competitive with market prices and are competitive with 
regard to the quality and delivery of the goods or services being purchased.  
 (2) In carrying out paragraph (1), a contracting officer shall consider a responsive offer 
timely received from an eligible small business offeror.  
 (3) Nothing in paragraph (1) shall be construed as precluding an award of a contract with 
a value not greater than $100,000 $500,000 under the authority of subsection (a) of section 8, 
section 2323 of title 10, United States Code, section 712 of the Business Opportunity 
Development Reform Act of 1988 (Public Law 100–656; 15 U.S.C. 644 note), or section 7102 of 
the Federal Acquisition Streamlining Act of 1994.  
 
 


******* 
 



https://www.law.cornell.edu/uscode/text/10

https://www.law.cornell.edu/uscode/text/10/712

https://www.law.cornell.edu/uscode/text/15

https://www.law.cornell.edu/uscode/text/15/usc_sec_15_00000644----000-notes



		§ 134. Simplified acquisition threshold






1 
 


SEC. 1220.  PERMANENT AUTHORITY TO TRANSPORT ALLIED PERSONNEL 1 


DURING CONTINGENCIES OR DISASTER RESPONSES.  2 


  Section 2649(c) of title 10, United States Code, is amended by striking “Until January 6, 3 


2016, when” and inserting “When”.  4 


Section-by-Section Analysis 


 This proposal would amend section 2649(c) of title 10, United States Code, to make 
permanent the current temporary authority of the Secretary of Defense to provide transportation 
to allied military personnel and civilians in contingencies or disaster responses on a 
noninterference basis, without charge, which expires on January 6, 2016. Making this authority 
permanent would allow the Secretary of Defense the flexibility to provide allied personnel 
transportation in situations in which a particular country may be supporting a contingency 
operation or a disaster response, but is unable to afford the cost of transportation, or 
circumstances preclude the collection of data needed to effect billing and reimbursement.  This 
authority is limited to providing transportation on a noninterference basis, when space is 
available on Department of Defense aircraft or vessels already scheduled to perform missions.   
 
Budgetary Implications:  If enacted, this proposal would not increase the budgetary 
requirements of the Department of Defense.    
 


RESOURCE SAVINGS ($THOUSANDS) 


  
FY 


2016 
FY 


2017 
FY 


2018 
FY 


2019 
FY 


2020 
Appropriation 


To 
Budget 
Activity 


Dash-
1 


Line 
Item 


Army +0 +0 +0 +0 +0 Operation & 
Maintenance, Army   


Navy +0 +0 +0 +0 +0 Operation & 
Maintenance, Navy   


Marine 
Corps +0 +0 +0 +0 +0 


Operation & 
Maintenance, Marine 


Corps 
  


Coast 
Guard +0 +0 +0 +0 +0 


Operation & 
Maintenance, Coast 


Guard 
  


Air 
Force +0 +0 +0 +0 +0 


Operation & 
Maintenance, Air 


Force  
  







2 
 


DOD +0 +0 +0 +0 +0 
Transportation 


Working Capital Fund 
97X4930 


02 FD50 


Total +0 +0 +0 +0 +0    
 
 


 NUMBER OF PERSONNEL AFFECTED 


  FY 
2016 


FY 
2017 


FY 
2018 


FY 
2019 


FY 
2020 


Appropriation 
To 


Personnel Type 
(Officer, Enlisted, or 


Civilian) 


Army 0 0 0 0 0 N/A N/A 


Navy 0 0 0 0 0 N/A N/A 
*Marine 
Corps 0 0 0 0 0 N/A N/A 


Air Force 0 0 0 0 0 N/A N/A 


Total 0 0 0 0 0     
 
Cost Methodology:  The cost of transporting allied personnel on already scheduled missions on 
a noninterference basis, on aircraft and vessels with excess capacity, is typically nil or very 
negligible.   
 
Changes to Existing Law:  This proposal would make the following change to section 2649 of 
title 10, United States Code:  
 
§ 2649.  Civilian passengers and commercial cargoes: transportation on Department of 


Defense vessels, vehicles, and aircraft 
 


(a) AUTHORITY.—Whenever space is unavailable on commercial lines and is 
    available on vessels, vehicles, or aircraft operated by the Department of Defense, 
    civilian passengers and commercial cargo may, in the discretion of the Secretary 
    of Defense, be transported on those vessels, vehicles, or aircraft. Rates for  
    transportation under this section may not be less than those charged by commercial 
    lines for the same kinds of service, except that in the case of transportation provided in  
    response to an emergency, a disaster, or a request for humanitarian assistance, any  
    amount charged for such transportation may not exceed the cost of providing the      
    transportation. 
 


 (b) CREDITING OF RECEIPTS.—Any amounts received under this section with 
respect to transportation provided in response to an emergency, a disaster, or a 
request for humanitarian assistance may be credited to the appropriation, fund, or 







3 
 


account used in incurring the obligation for which such amount is received.  In all 
other cases, amounts received under this section shall be covered into the Treasury as 
miscellaneous receipts.  


 
 (c) TRANSPORTATION OF ALLIED PERSONNEL DURING CONTINGENCIES OR 
DISASTER RESPONSES.—Until January 6, 2016, when When space is available on 
vessels, vehicles, or aircraft operated by the Department of Defense and the Secretary 
of Defense determines operations in the area of  a contingency operation or disaster 
response would be facilitated if allied forces or civilians were to be transported using 
such vessels, vehicles, or aircraft, the Secretary may provide such transportation on a 
noninterference basis, without charge. 


 
 
  
 








1 


SEC. 506. AUTHORITY TO CONDUCT WARRANT OFFICER RETIRED GRADE 1 


DETERMINATIONS. 2 


Section 1371 of title 10, United States Code, is amended— 3 


(1) by inserting “highest” after “in the”; and 4 


(2) by striking “that he held on the day before the date of his retirement, or in 5 


any higher warrant officer grade”. 6 


[Please note: The “Changes to Existing Law” section below sets out in red-line format how 
the legislative text above would amend existing law.] 


 


Section-by-Section Analysis: 


 This proposal would amend section 1371 of title 10, United States Code, to provide that 
warrant officers retire in the highest grade in which they served satisfactorily before retirement. 
Currently, there is no authority to retire a warrant officer in a lower grade based upon 
substantiated misconduct or substandard performance of duty since the officer’s last promotion.  
The absence of such authority sets warrant officers apart from other commissioned officers and 
enlisted members who, under certain circumstances, are placed on the retired list at a grade lower 
than the highest grade they held while in the service.   
 
 Pursuant to section 1370 of title 10, a commissioned officer (other than a commissioned 
warrant officer) retires in the highest grade satisfactorily held, as determined by the Secretary of 
the military department concerned.  Thus, a commissioned officer above the warrant officer 
grades is subject to a mandatory grade determination upon retirement if the officer, since the 
officer’s last promotion, was the subject of any adverse finding or conclusion from an officially 
documented investigation, proceeding, or inquiry that is, or should have been, documented in the 
officer’s record.  In practical terms, any negative of derogatory information in the commissioned 
officer’s file since the officer’s most recent promotion – whether it involves misconduct or 
substandard performance of duty – should automatically trigger a grade determination review 
upon retirement.   


 Unlike warrant officers, enlisted soldiers during their careers may be subject to a 
reduction in rank for inefficiency; as the result of punishment pursuant to proceedings under 
Article 15, Uniform Code of Military Justice; or as the result of a court-martial sentence.  When 
so reduced, an enlisted member often retires not at the highest grade held (unless there is a 
determination that service in that grade was nonetheless satisfactory), but at the grade the soldier 
holds on the day before retirement.   


 This proposed change to section 1371 is especially timely as section 571 of title 10, 
United States Code, was amended by section 502 of the FY 2011 NDAA to allow the Secretaries 
of the military departments to appoint WO1s by commission.  That amendment removed any 
meaningful distinction between warrant officers and more senior commissioned officers when it 
comes to method of appointment. 







2 


 
Budgetary Implications:  The Army and Navy have processes for conducting retired grade 
determinations for other retiring commissioned officers.  Normally, an officer by default will 
retire in the officer’s current grade. A retired grade determination review becomes necessary if 
the officer has negative or derogatory information filed in the officer’s official personnel since 
the officer’s last promotion.  Cases requiring a retired grade determination are identified by the 
Service’s military personnel commands when the officer submits a voluntary retirement request 
or submits a request to retire in lieu of elimination.  For other commissioned officers, these cases 
are forwarded to the Office of Manpower and Reserve Affairs (or designee) for the Service for a 
retired grade determination.  The administrative task of requesting that Services conduct grade 
determination review boards for warrant officers can be handled by existing personnel and would 
generate minimal additional cost.  Based on Agency case load and the agency budget, the Army 
estimates that it costs an average of $940 to process a case submitted to the Army Review 
Boards Agency.  Thirty additional cases would generate a cost of $28,200.  The Navy estimates 
that it costs an average of $200.00 to process a case.  Fifteen additional cases would generate a 
cost of $3,000. 
 


RESOURCE REQUIREMENTS ($MILLIONS) 


 FY 
2016 


FY 
2017 


FY 
2018 


FY 
2019 


FY 
2020 


Appropriation 
From 


Budget 
Activity 


Dash-
1 


Line 
Item 


Program 
Element 


Army .028 .028 .028 .028 .028 
Operation and 
Maintenance, 


Army 
04 431 0902398A 


Air Force      


Air Force does 
not have 
warrant 
officers. 


   


Navy .003 .003 .003 .003 .003 
Operation and 
Maintenance, 


Navy 
01 BSS1 0208560N 


Marine 
Corps      


Marine Corps 
does not intend 


to use this 
authority. 


   


Total .031 .031 .031 .031 .031     


 
The proposal would result in minor savings from a reduction in retired pay for warrant officers 
who retire in a lower grade as a result of a Grade Determination Review Board decision.  The 
Army estimates an average annual saving in retired pay of $3,983 for each warrant officer so 
reduced.  The Army estimates approximately 40 percent of grade determination cases result in 
retirement of the officer in a lower grade.  The Navy estimates an average annual saving in 
retired pay of $4,063 for each warrant officer so reduced.  The Navy estimates approximately 40 
percent of grade determination cases result in retirement of the officer in a lower grade.   







3 


 
PERSONNEL AFFECTED  


 FY 
2016 


FY 
2017 


FY 
2018 


FY 
2019 


FY 
2020 


Appropriation 
From 


Budget 
Activity 


Dash-1 
Line 
Item 


Program 
Element 


Army 12 12 12 12 12 
Military 


Personnel, 
Army 


1 10 0904901A 


Air 
Force      


Air Force does 
not have 
warrant 
officers. 


   


Navy 6 6 6 6 6 
Military 


Personnel, 
Navy 


1 10 Various 


Marine 
Corps      


Marine Corps 
does not intend 


to use this 
authority. 


   


Total 18 18 18 18 18     
 
Change to Existing Law:  This proposal would make the following changes to section 1371 of 
title 10, United States Code: 
 
§ 1371. Warrant officers: general rule  


 Unless entitled to a higher retired grade under some other provision of law, a warrant 
officer retires, as determined by the Secretary concerned, in the highest permanent regular or 
reserve warrant officer grade, if any, that he held on the day before the date of his retirement, or 
in any higher warrant officer grade in which he served on active duty satisfactorily, as 
determined by the Secretary, for a period of more than 30 days. 





		SEC. 506. AUTHORITY TO CONDUCT WARRANT OFFICER RETIRED GRADE DETERMINATIONS.

		Section 1371 of title 10, United States Code, is amended—

		(1) by inserting “highest” after “in the”; and

		(2) by striking “that he held on the day before the date of his retirement, or in any higher warrant officer grade”.

		Section-by-Section Analysis:

		The proposal would result in minor savings from a reduction in retired pay for warrant officers who retire in a lower grade as a result of a Grade Determination Review Board decision.  The Army estimates an average annual saving in retired pay of $3,9...

		Change to Existing Law:  This proposal would make the following changes to section 1371 of title 10, United States Code:



